
ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 

BID #15-08 Print Shop Paper Supplies 

Open Date 0812112015 10:00 AM CST 

Close 0910912015 2:00 PM CST 

1 20# Paper- 8.5" x 11"- Assorted Pastel 

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes I Alternate Description Manufacturer 
Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 200 Cartons $35.70 $7,140.00 Hammermill Colors 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 200 Cartons $37.27 $7,454.00 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 200 Cartons $42.70 $8,540.00 Hammermill colors 5000/ctn 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 200 Cartons $44.45 $8,890.00 g~~.~.~ .~ .. ~.~.~~~P..~~P.~~.~ .. ~~.~~~~· ··· · ···· · ···· ·· · ··· · ·· ········ ··· - .······················································································· ······· ······················· ·························· 
:: : : :::: : :::: : ::}~~:;:~9.r:::: ::: 3i.§;?.?9.;:g:g: 

······································ 
~ [AL Tl] Officewise Furniture & Supply 1200 Cartons !::.'!~.~.~~.~.~~ .. ~.~ .. ?..l.~ .. ~q.~~.~~ : ... ~.~'!..~.~.?g.?.J.~.~~ UNIVERSAL 

- ································································· ·· ································· ················· ..................... ..... . ..................................... 

2 8.5 x 11 - 20# Carbonless Reverse I 
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 
Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 40 cartons No Bid 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 40 cartons No Bid 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 cartons $81.25 $3,250.00 NCR 5000ictn 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 40 cartons $110.95 $4,438.00 Appvion Papers NCR 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 40 cartons $148.72 $5,948.80 

3 67# Vellum Bristol- 8.5" x 11"- Assorted I 
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes I Alternate Description Manufacturer 
Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 120 cartons $30.00 $3,600.00 Exact Vellum Bristol 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 120 cartons $34.52 $4,142.40 Domtar Colors Vellum Bristol 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 120 cartons $35.80 $4,296.00 Springhill 2000/ctn 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 120 cartons $40.95 $4,914.00 
f-.····································· ·································································· ·· ·· ·········· .. .. ........ .............. 

: :: :::::::::::: ::~~~;:i?r: : :::: : : ::~i.i.;#.~~;:~:g: 
............................................ ................ ............. ............................ ...................................... 

~ [AL Tl] Officewise Furniture & Supply 1120 cartons .~'!~.~.~.~.~.~ . !.~ .. ?. .. ~q_~g~~.: ... '!Y~.~~~?~.~ .. (~~Y. .~.~~.~~.~ .. ~~!::.~!. 1-···························· ······························································· ·······r ················ .......................... 

4 60# Paper- 8.5" x 11"- Assorted Brights 

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 
Contract Paper Group, Inc. 280 Cartons $47.80 $13,384.00 Mohawk Brite Hue 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 280 Cartons $56.70 $15,876.00 Astrobrights 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 280 Cartons $63.65 $17,822.00 Domtar Hots Text 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 280 Cartons $70.00 $19,600.00 Astrobrights text 5000/ctn 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 280 Cartons $151.90 $42,532.00 ASTROBRIGHTS BRAND. AVAILABLE IN 25 C 

5 65# Cover- 8.5" x 11"- 65# Brights 

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 
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Contract Paper Group, Inc. 160 Cartons $38.97 $6,235.20 Mohawk Brite Hue 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc., oper 160 Cartons $44.88 $7,180.80 Astrobrights 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 160 Cartons $54.12 $8,659.20 Astrobrights Cover 2000/ctn 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 160 Cartons $64.30 $10,288.00 Domtar Hots Cover 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 160 Cartons $146.24 $23,398.40 ASTROBRIGHTS BRAND. AVAILABLE IN 25 ( 

6 2" X 8 5/8" x 111/8" White Stationary I 
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 2 Cartons No Bid 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 2 Cartons No Bid 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 2 Cartons No Bid 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 2 Cartons $35.73 $71.46 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 2 Cartons $39.19 $78.38 100/ctn 

7 4" X 8 5/8" x 111/8" White Stationary I 
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 2 Cartons No Bid 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 2 Cartons No Bid 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 2 Cartons No Bid 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 2 Cartons No Bid 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 2 Cartons $73.20 $146.40 

8 100# Cover, 8.5 x 11, White I I I 
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 10 Cartons No Bid 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 10 Cartons No Bid 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 10 Cartons $46.72 $467.20 Accent cover 1600/ctn 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 10 Cartons $50.49 $504.90 Domtar Lynx Opaque Cover 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 10 Cartons $85.00 $850.00 

9 80# Glossy Text, 8.5 x 11, White I I I I I 
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 10 Cartons No Bid 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 10 Cartons No Bid 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 10 Cartons $35.67 $356.70 Nekoosa Coateed Products 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 10 Cartons $60.60 $606.00 Futura Gloss 4000/ctn 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 10 Cartons $79.00 $790.00 

10 11 x 17, 67# Vellum Bristol, White I I 
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Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 
Officewise Furniture & Supply 10 Cartons No Bid 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 10 Cartons $34.60 $346.00 SpringhilllOOO/ctn 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 10 Cartons $36.31 $363.10 Domtar Vellum Bristol! 

Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 10 Cartons $41.00 $410.00 Staples Vellum Bristol 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 10 Cartons $57.70 $577.00 

11 8.5 x 11, 67# Vellum Bristol, White 

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 
Staples Contract & Commercial, Inc. 80 Cartons $28.40 $2,272.00 Exact Vellum Bristol 

Graphic Equipment & Supply 80 Cartons $32.74 $2,619.20 Domtar Vellum Bristol 

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 80 Cartons $34.00 $2,720.00 Springhill 2000/ctn 

Contract Paper Group, Inc. 80 Cartons $39.38 $3,150.40 

Officewise Furniture & Supply 80 Cartons $96.40 $7,712.00 WAUSAU EXACT BRAND. WAU80211 

Awarded Vendors in red 
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