Bid Request Number Bid #09-46 Addendum 1

Title Office/Classroom Supplies

Bid Type BID

Cpen Date 7/2/2009 8:00:00 AM Central

Close Date 7117/2009 2:00:00 PM Central

{Line 1 Batterios, AAA B/PK.
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Stapies Advantage 1 per 8/p 2.72 272

QUILL CORPORATION 1 per 8/p 31 3M

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 per 8/p 5.92 592

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 per 8/p No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 per 8/p No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 per 8/p No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 4 2/pk 1.94 7.76 S5 #090164

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 per 8/p 6.94 6.94 EVEREADY MAX 8 PACK
|Line 2 Batteries, AA 8/PK =
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 per8/p 2.56 2.56

QUILL CORPORATION 1 per 8/p 3.41 3N

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 per 8/p 6.01 6.01

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 per 8/p No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 per 8/p No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 per 8/p No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 2 4/pk 3.34 6.68 SS #090166

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 per 8/p 6.94 6.94 EVEREADY MAX 8 PACK
iLine 3 Batteries, C 8/PK:.
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 per 8/p 4.08 4.08

QUILL CORPORATION 1 per 8/p 6.1 6.1

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 per8ip 12.68 12.68

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 per 8/p No Bid

S & S Worldwide 1 per 8/p No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 per 8/p No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 4 2/pk 3.34 13.36 SS #090168

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 per 8/p 11.72 11.72 EVEREADY MAX 8 PACK
|Line 4 Batteries, D 8/PK *.°
Name QTY UGM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA per 52 52

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA per 6.1 6.1




Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA per 12.82 12.82

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA per No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA per No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA per No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 1 8/pk 11.35 11.35 SS#090170

Baker Office Products {Alt 1) 1 EA per 11.72 11.72 EVEREADY MAX & PACK
[Line 5 Batteries, 9-Volt 4/PKiIC
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA per 4.76 476

QUILL CORPORATICN 1 EA per 6.1 6.1

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA per 9.69 9.69

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA per No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA per No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA per No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 4 ea 3.34 13.36 SS #090172

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA per 11.72 11.72 EVEREADY MAX 4 PACK
|Line 6 Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue, White —Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black ' .
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products 1 EA 2.09 2.09

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 2.14 2.14

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 265 265

Staples Advaniage 1 EA 3.99 3.99

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA  NoBid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 7 Binder, 1" D-ring, Red = JBinder, 1" D-ring, Royal Bluet i~
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 1.51 1.51

Baker Office Products 1 EA 2.74 274

Staples Advantage 1 EA 2.75 2.75

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 3.71 37

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

School Speciaity 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 8 Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue, White_ ;Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black™ "l
Name QTY UQOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Hester?s Office Furniture and
Baker Office Products
QUILL CORPORATICN

— — h

EA 2.89 2.89
EA 2.89 2.89
EA 3.55 3.55




Staples Advantage 1EA 498 498

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

[Line 9 Binder, 2" D-ring, Red! 'Binder, 2" D-ring, Royal Bluelitil_
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Exiended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 3.04 3.04

Baker Office Products 1EA 376 3.76

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 4.88 4.88

Staples Advantage 1 EA 5.48 5,48

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1EA  NoBid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 10 Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue, White$~Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue, BlackCC
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 3.52 3.52

Baker Office Products 1 EA 3.59 3.59

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 573 573

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.91 6.91

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

School Speciaity 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA NoBid

Eine 11 Binder, 4" D-ring, non stick Vus, White 11 Binder, 4" d-ring, non stick Vue, Black: "
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 4.41 4.41

Baker Office Products 1EA 4.44 4.44

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 9.07 9.07

Staples Advantage 1 EA 117 1.7

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA NoBid

|I_.ine 12 Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue, White: 1. 1Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black: "
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products 1 EA 10.85 10.85

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 11.11 11.11

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 16 16

Staples Advantage 1 EA 23 23




AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA  NoBid

School Specialty 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid
{Line 13 Clamps, 1.5" Med. 50/bxCC
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 pkg 0.71 0.71

Staples Advantage 1 pkg 0.75 0.75

QUILL CORPORATION 1 pkg 0.79 0.79

S & S WorldWide 1 pkg No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 pkg NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 pkg NoBid

Baker Office Products 1 pkg No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 pkg 1.01 1.01 CLAMPS,1.5" MEDIUM
{Line 14 Clamps, 2 5/8" Lg.,12/bx(
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Schoo! Specialty 1 PKG 0.42 0.42

Staples Advantage 1 PKG 0.49 0.49

QUILL CORPORATION 1 PKG 0.58 0.58

S & S WorldWide 1 PKG No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 PKG NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 PKG NoBid

Baker Office Products 1 PKG No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 PKG 0.56 0.56 Clamps, 2 5/8" Lg.,12/bx
[Line 15 Clips, Paper, #1 small, 10 boxes/pkg: =
Name QTY UGOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 100 ct/ 1.21 1.2%

Baker Office Products 1 100 ctf 1.39 1.39

Staples Advantage 1100 ct/ 1.47 1.47

School Specialty 1 100 ct/ 1.5 1.5

QUILL CORPORATION 1 100 ct/ 1.59 1.59

S & S WorldWide 1 100 ct/ No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 4100 ct/ No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 100 ct/ No Bid

[Line 186 Clips, Paper, Jumbor'i_
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Speciaity 1 EA 0.43 043

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.52 0.52

Staples Advantage 1EA 38 38

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA NoBid

S & S Worldwide 1EA No Bid



Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Producis (Alt 1) 1 EA 0.41 0.41 LEGACY BRAND JUMBO PAPER CLIPS
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 3.92 3.92 Clips, Paper, Jumbo

|Line 17 Clips, 3/8" Binder, 12/bx(:T
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.14 0.14

School Specialty 1 EA 0.15 0.15

Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.17 0.17

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA 0.24 0.24

S & § WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 0.23 0.23 Clips, 3/8" Binder, 12/bx

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 0.23 0.23 LEGACY BRAND BINDER CLIPS
[Line 18 Clips, 5/8" Binder, 12/bx_
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.35 0.35

School Specialty 1 EA 0.36 0.36

Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.44 0.44

AFP INDUSTRIES, iNC. 1 EA 0.46 0.46

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 0.51 0.51 Clips, 5/8" Binder, 12/bx

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1EA 0.52 0.52 LEGACY BRAND BINDER CLIPS
[Line 19 Clips, 1" Binder, 12/bx .~
Name QTY UOCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.89 0.89

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 1.17 1.17

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.26 1.26

School Specialty 1 EA 82 82

S & § WorldWide 1EA NoBid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1EA 1.27 1.27 LEGACY BRAND BINDER CLIPS
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 1.32 1.32 Clips, 1" Binder, 12/bx
[Line 20 Discs, CD-RW Re-writable Discs .
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Aiternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.51 0.51

Staples Advantage 1 EA 2.62 2.62

Baker Office Products 1 EA 7.98 7.98

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 8.12 8.12

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid




S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

[Line 21 Envelopes, 6 x 8 Redi-Seal, 100/bxL"(:
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1BX 6.39 6.39

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 BX No Bid

S & S WorldWide 18X No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 BX No Bid

School Specialty 1 BX 0 0]

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 BX No Bid

Schoo! Specialty (Ait 1) 1 BX 5.44 5.44 S5 ##085023

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1BX 7.95 7.95 WESTVACO BRAND 6X8 ENVELOPES
QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1 BX 18.04 18.04

[Line 22 Envelopes, 9 x 12 Clasp, 100/bxC .
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 BX 475 475

Schoot Specialty 1 BX 5.49 5.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 BX 5.49 5.49

Staples Advantage 1 BX 6.45 6.45

S & S WorldWide 1 BX No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 BX No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 BX 5.37 5.37 LEGACY BRAND 9X12 ENVELOPES
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 BX 7.09 7.09 Envelopes, 2 x 12 Clasp, 100/kx
|Line 23 Envelopes, Brown Inter-Office, 300/bx: -
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Exiended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1 EA 10.4 10.4

Staples Advantage 1 EA 33.87 33.87

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 17.6 17.6 Envelopes, Brown Inter-Office, 100/bx
|Line 24 Envelopes, Brown Inter-Office, 300/bx -
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Altermate Specification

School Specialty 1 EA 10.4 104

Staples Advantage 1 EA 39.96 39.96

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid




Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1EA 9.98 9.98
JLine 25 Eraser, Dry Erase, EXPOLILI
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1EA 0.76 0.76

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA 0.93 0.93

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 1.19 1.19

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 1.46 1.46

Baker Office Products 1 EA 1.48 1.48

School Speciaity 1 EA 1.52 1.52

S & S Worldwide 1EA 4.09 4.09

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 26 Eraser, Pink Pearl, large, 12/bx 1"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 BX 1.08 1.06

Staples Advantage 1 BX 31 31

QUILL CORPORATION 1 BX 3.4 3.41

Baker Office Products 1 BX 422 422

School Specialty 1 BX 433 433

Hester?s Office Furniture and . 1 BX 4.36 4.36

S & S WorldWide 1 BX No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 BX No Bid
[Line 27 Eraser Caps for pencils, 12/pkgl
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 PKG 0.19 0.19

QUILL CORPORATION 1 PKG 0.24 0.24

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 PKG 0.51 0.51

S & S WorldWide 1 PKG 475 475

Simon Marketing Inc 1 PKG No Bid

Raker Office Products 1 PKG NoBid

School Specialty 1 PKG NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 PKG NoBid

|Line 28 Eraser, Clic Eraser:
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.75 0.75

School Specialty 1 EA 0.87 0.87

Baker Office Products 1 EA 0.97 097

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid




Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 29 File Box, ECISD approved, letter/legall
Name QTY LOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1 EA 213 2143

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA 26.77 26.77

Staples Advantage 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 1.59 1.50 LEGACY BRAND STCRAGE BOXES
Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 1.69 1.69 File Box, letter/legal lift-off lid,economy
QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1 EA 16.81 16.81 BID-730815 QUILL BRAND STORAGE BOXUOLETTER/ALEGAL, SOLD 12 PER CT, 350 LBS $16.81/CT
[Line 30 File Folders, Letter, (blue, green, org., red, yel.) T
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUIIL CORPORATION 1 EA 8.51 8.51

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 9.27 9.27

Baker Office Products 1 EA 15.22 15.22

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 16 16

School Specialty 1 EA 16.58 16.58

Staples Advantage 1EA 16.92 16.92

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc i1 EA  NoBid

mne 31 File Folder, Letter, (gray, maroon, navy, pur., teal)i. _
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 8.51 8.51

Staples Advantage 1 EA 15.63 15.63

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 18.47 18.47

School Specialty 1 EA 20.11 20.11

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

S & § WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

|Line 32 File Folders, Letter, Manila, 2 ply, 1/3 cut, 100/bx.
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 6.53 6.53

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 7.47 7.47

Staples Advantage 1 EA 7.7 7.7

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 9.43 9.43

School Specialty 1EA 10.62 10.62

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 929 9.29 UNIVERSAL 2 PLY FILE FOLDERS




ILine 33

File Folders, Legal, Manila, 2 ply, 1/3 cut, 100/bx(1.}

Name LUOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA 7.67 7.67

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 8.8 8.8

Staples Advantage 1 EA 10.21 10.21

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 12.29 12.29

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

School Specialty 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 11.73 11.73 UNIVERSAL 2 PLY FILE FOLDERS
Iﬁne 34 Folder, Hanging, letter, 3 1/2” Clear Tab, 25/bx 10
Name UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 413 413

School Specialty 1 EA 432 432

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 4.41 4.41

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 557 5.57

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.46 6.46

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 482 4 82 LEGACY HANGING FILE FOLDERS
|Line 35 Folder, Hanging, legal, 3 1/2" Clear Tab, 25/bx-]
Name UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 5.22 5.22

School Specialty 1 EA 5.98 5.08

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 6.45 6.45

QUILL. CORPORATION 1 EA 6.62 6.62

Staples Advantage 1EA 7.75 7.75

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 6.49 6.49 LEGACY HANGING FILE FOLDERS
[Line 36 Folder, Packet wifasteners, 25{bx, asst. colorsL!
Name UOM Unit Price Extended Aiternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 4.42 442

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 6.13 6.13

School Specialty 1 EA 6.18 6.18

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 6.49 6.49

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marieting Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid




[Line 37

Glue Stick, .26 oz., Permanent, 12/bx """

Name UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1 BX 1.81 1.51

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1BX 1.62 1.62

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 BX 2.88 2.88

Staples Advantage 1 BX 37 37

Baker Office Products 1 BX No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 BX No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 BX No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1 BX 3.36 3.36 BID-72211, QUILL BRAND 0.28 OZNNSOLD EACH $0.28 OR $3.36DZ
[Line 38 Labels, Laser, 1" x 2 5/8", white. 100 per box: "
Name UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 5.41 5.41

School Specialty 1 EA 547 547

Staples Advantage 1 EA 7.43 7.43

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA 7.6 7.6

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 9.71 9.71

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 7.44 7.44 LEGACY LASER LABELS
[Line 39 Labels, Laser, 1 1/3" x 4", white . _

Name UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 483 483

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 5.41 5.41

School Specialty 1 EA 547 5.47

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA 76 76

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 9.71 9.71

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Ait 1) 1 EA 7.44 7.44 LEGACY LASER LABELS

[Line 40 Labels, File Folder, 248 labels/pkg, asst. colors ™’
Name UOM  Unit Price Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.5 1.5

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA  NoBid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1 EA 1.28 1.28 BID-733820 QUILL BRANDOOSOLD 496/PACK, ASST

[Line 41

Labels, File Folder, 248 labels/pkg. Purple.._




Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1 EA 0.62 0.62

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.69 0.69

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.37 1.37

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

|Line 42 Markers, Dry Erase (EXPO) § pk, SANFORDOI[}
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

S & S WorldWide 1 PK 4.09 4.09

Baker Office Products 1PK 5.89 5.89

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1PK 593 5.93

School Specialty 1PK 6.03 6.03

Staples Advantage 1 PK 10.2 10.2

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 PK No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 PK No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 PK No Bid

[Line 43 Markers, Dry Erase, 4 color set, chisel, EXPOTIC
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 2.1 2.1

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 2.79 2.79

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 2.87 2.87

Staples Advantage 1EA 2.91 2.91

Baker Office Products 1EA 298 2.98

School Specialty 1EA 3.08 3.06

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

|Line 44 Markers, Black Marks-a-Lot, Ig. Chisel tip, 12/bx: !.
Name QTY UOM LUnit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Hester?s Office Furniture and EA 235 2.35

1

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 4.71 471

Staples Advantage 1EA 5.82 5.82

Baker Office Products 1 EA 5.89 5.89

School Specialty 1 EA 6.35 6.35

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 45 Markers, Permanent, Sharpie, Fine pt., 4 color seti"/".

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification




QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 2.2 2.2

Staples Advantage 1 EA 228 228

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 2.32 2.32

School Speciaity 1 EA 24 24

Baker Office Products 1 EA 2.59 2.59

S & § Worldwide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing tnc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

iLine 46 Markers, Perm., Sharpie, Fine Pt., 12/bx, Blackr i/
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 499 4,99

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 6.56 6.56

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.59 6.59

Baker Office Products 1 EA 6.59 6.59

School Specialty 1 EA 6.92 6.92

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 912 912

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
[Line 47 Markers, Perm., Sharpie, Fine Pt., 12/bx, Red_:
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 5.59 5.59

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 6.56 6.56

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.59 6.59

Baker Office Products 1EA 6.59 6.59

School Specialty 1 EA 6.92 6.92

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
[Line 48 Markers, Perm., Sharpis, Fine Pt., 12/bx, Violet_ "
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATICN 1 EA 5.58 5.59

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 6.56 6.56

Baker Office Products 1 EA 6.59 6.59

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.65 6.65

School Specialty 1 EA 6.92 6.92

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 49 Markers, Transparency (vis-?-vis}, 8 pk.i”
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 4.45 4.45




Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 5.36 5.36

Staples Advantage 1EA 5.38 5.38

Baker Cffice Products 1EA 5.49 5.49

School Specialty 1 EA 5.65 5.65

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simaon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

|Line 50 Markers, Transparency {vis-?-vis), 4 pki0
Name QTY UCM Unii Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 1.99 1.99

Staples Advantage 1 EA 273 2.73

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 275 2.75

Baker Office Products 1EA 2.79 2.79

School Specialty 1EA 2.86 2.86

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

[Line 51 Paper, Notebook Filler Paper, 10.5 x 8, white.~
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 1.18 1.18

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.32 1.32

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 1.47 1.47

School Specialty 1EA 2.49 2.49

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 1.49 1.49 MEAD FILLER PAPER
[Line 52 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, asst. colors, 50 shts/pki
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification
S & S WorldWide 1EA 0.7 0.7

School Specialty 1 EA 0.76 0.76

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

[Line 53 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Biue, 50 shts/pki_
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 0.54 0.64

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 0.7 0.7




QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA No Bid

[Line 54 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Yellow, 50 shts/pki .
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 0.63 0.63

S & S WorldWide 1EA 0.7 0.7

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Fumiture and - 1EA No Bid

[Line 55 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Holiday Green, 50 shts/pk~"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 0.64 0.64

S & 3 WorldWide 1 EA 07 0.7

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advantage 1EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

|Line 56 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Black, 50 shts/pk
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 0.68 0.68

S & S WorldWide 1EA 07 0.7

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advaniage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

|Line 57 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Orange, 50 shts/pk: "
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification
S & S WorldWide 1 EA 0.7 0.7

School Specialty 1 EA 0.75 0.75

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.84 0.84




Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

|Line 58 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Brown, 50 shits/pkoC:
Name QTY LOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 0.69 0.69

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 0.7 0.7

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing nc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

[Line 59 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Holiday Red, 50 shts/pk_":
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
S & S WorldWide 1 EA 0.7 0.7

School Specialty 1 EA 0.84 0.84

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advaniage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

[Line 60 Paper, Const., 9 x 12, Bright White, 50 shts/pk_ :
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 0.68 0.68

S & § WorldWide 1EA 07 0.7

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.84 0.84

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.49 1.49

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA No Bid

[Line 64 Paper, Const., 12 x 18, asst. colors, 50 shts/pki !
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 1.47 1.47

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 1.8 1.8

Staples Advaniage 1 EA 3.19 3.19

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC, 1EA No Bid



Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0 0

{Line 62 Paper, Post-it, 1.5 x 2, Asst. Pastel, 12/pk="
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 3.78 378

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 4.44 444

Staples Advantage 1 EA 4.45 4.45

Baker Office Products 1EA 469 4.69

School Specialty 1EA 6.6 6.6

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
iLine 63 Paper, Post-lt, 1.5 x 2, Neon, 12/pki |
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 4.69 4.69

Staples Advantage 1 EA 4.96 4.96

Baker Office Products 1EA 5.08 5.08

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 518 5.18

School Specialty 1 EA 5.42 5.42

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 64 Paper, Post-It, 1.5 x 2, Aquatic, 12/pk
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 4,76 476

Staples Advantage 1 EA 4.96 4.96

Baker Office Products 1 EA 5.08 5.08

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 5.18 518

School Specialty 1 EA 542 5.42

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA  NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
[Line 65 Paper, Postt, 3 x 3, Asst. Pastels, 12/pk ™~
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 8.65 8.65

Baker Office Products 1 EA .98 9.98

Staples Advantage 1EA 9.99 9.99

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 10.12 10.12

School Specialty 1 EA 11.13 11.13



S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

[Line 66 Paper, Post-It, 3 x 3, Neon, 5/pki12)
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 4.6 4.6

Staples Advantage 1EA 479 479

Baker Office Products 1 EA 4.89 489

School Specialty 1 EA 525 525

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 67 Paper, Postt, 3 x 3, Aquatic, 5/pki_{
Name QTyY WUOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPCRATICN 1 EA 46 46

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 478 478

Staples Advantage 1 EA 4.79 4.79

Baker Office Products 1 EA 4.89 4.89

School Specialty 1 EA 5.25 5.25

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

ILine 68 Paper, Post-It, 3 x 5, Asst. Pastel, 5/pkD
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products 1 EA 5.49 5.49

Staples Advantage 1 EA 571 571

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 5.89 5.89

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 59 59

School Specialty 1EA 8.93 8.93

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

[Line 69 Paper, Post-H, 3 x 5, Neon, 5/pk....
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 6.07 6.07

Baker Office Products 1 EA 6.22 6.22

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 6.32 6.32

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.33 6.33

School Speciaity 1 EA 6.92 6.92

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid




AFP INDUSTRIES, iNC. 1 EA No Bid

|Line 70 Paper, Post-It, 3 x 5, Aquatic, S/pkCC
Name QTY UOM Unii Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 6.07 6.07

Baker Office Products 1 EA 6.22 6.22

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 6.32 6.32

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.33 6.33

School Specialty 1EA 6.92 6.92

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

[Line 71 Paper, Post-it, 4 x 6, Lined, Aquatic colors, 3/pk ..
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 595 5.95

Baker Office Products 1EA 6.12 6.12

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 6.18 6.18

Staples Advantage 1 EA 62 6.2

School Specialty 1 EA 6.78 6.78

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

|Line 72 Paper, Post-It, 3 x 3 Pop-Up, Aquatic, 6/pk
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 5.91 591

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.15 6.15

Baker Office Products 1 EA 6.48 6.48

Schoo! Specialty 1 EA 6.73 6.73

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 73 Paper, Post-It Flags, 1" (write-on), 4/pk, bright colors.._
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Allernate Specification
QUILL CORFPORATION 1 EA 58 5.8

Baker Office Products 1 EA 5.96 5.96

Staples Advantage 1EA 6.04 6.04

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 7.68 7.68

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid




|Line 74

Paper, Post-it Flags, "Sign Here" i

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUIILL CORPORATION 1 EA 2.95 2.95

Staples Advantage 1 EA 3.48 3.48

Baker Office Products 1 EA 3.76 3.76

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 411 411

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simoen Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid
Paper, Ruled Pad, 5 x 8, white, 12/pk,
Paper, Ruled Pad, 5 x 8, yellow, 12/pk, 50
sheets per pad.:

Line 75

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 2 2

Staples Advantage 1 EA 2.37 2.37

School Specialty 1 EA 37 3.7

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 4.03 4.03 LEGACY BRAND 5X8 PADS, WHITE AND CANARY

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 4.95 4.95 UNV 46300 CANNNUNV 46200 WHT
Paper, Ruled Pad, letter, white 12/pk,
Paper, Ruled Pad, letter, yellow, 12/pk, 50
sheets per pad”

Line 76

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 45 4.5

Staples Advantage 1 EA 4.59 4.59

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 6.13 6.13

School Specialty 1 EA 6.32 6.32

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1} 1 EA 5.78 5.78 LEGACY BRAND LETTER RULED PADS
Paper, Ruled Pad, legal, white, 12/pk,
Paper, Ruted Pad, legal, yellow, 12/pk, 50
sheets per pad

Line 77

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Alternate Specification




QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 5 5

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.25 6.25

School Specialty 1 EA 8.32 §8.32

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 10.88 10.88

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 8.29 8.29 LEGACY BRAND LEGAL RULED PADS
|Line 78 Pen, Highlighter, yellow, 12/bx'
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 1.35 1.35

Staples Advantage 1EA 1.36 1.36

School Specialty 1 EA 1.72 1.72

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 3.74 374

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1} 1 EA 2.98 2 98 EBERHARD FABER {SANFORD) YELLOW LIGHLITERS
|Line 79 Pen, Highlighter, 6 color et
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.69 0.69

Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.84 0.84

School Specialty 1EA 0.91 0.91

Baker Office Products 1 EA 279 2.79

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

|Line 80 Pen, Highlighter, 6 color seti'C
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.69 0.69

Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.84 0.84

Schoo! Specialty 1EA 0.91 0.91

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1EA 1.69 1.69 UNIVERSAL 5 COLOR SET
[Line 81 Pen, Ballpoint, Round Stick, 12/pkr !
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 08 08



QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.85 0.85

Baker Office Products 1 EA 0.98 0.98

School Specialty 1 EA 1.1 1.1

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 1.14 1.14

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
fLine 82 Pencil, #2 wleraser, 12/bx
Name Qry UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.37 0.37

School Specialty 1EA 0.44 0.44

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 0.48 0.48

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 0.48 0.48

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.55 0.55

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1} 1 EA 0.48 0.48 UNIVERSAL PENCILS
[Line 83 Pencil, 3.5" no eraser, 144/bx_; _
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 2.79 279

School Specialty 1 EA 3.04 3.04

S & S Worldwide 1 EA 492 492

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Staples Advantage 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid
[Line 84 Pencil, Mechanical Grip, Asst. Colors .5mm leadi.
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Baker Office Products 1 EA 3.29 3.29

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 414 414

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

Staples Advantage 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1EA 0.64 0.64 BID-66055 PAPERMATE CLICKSTERDDSOLD PER DOZEN $7.68/DZ
School Speciaity (Alt 1) 1 doz 1.2 1.2 SS #084809

[Line 85 Pencil, Sharpener, Wall Mount HD Metall
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 6.31 6.31

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 6.69 6.69




School Specialty 1EA 6.89 6.89

Staples Advantage 1 EA 7.35 7.35

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 12.31 12.31

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1EA 6.44 6.44 STANLEY BOSTITCH MANUEL SHARPENER
[Line 86 Pencil, Sharpener, ElectricC 0
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1EA 8.74 8.74

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 95 9.5

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 10.83 10.83

Baker Office Products 1 EA 14.46 14.46

Schoo! Specialty 1 EA 15.13 15.13

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 15.7 15.7

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid
iLine 87 Pencil, Sharpener, Hand-Hetd[.
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Schooi Specialty 1 EA 0.31 0.31

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.62 0.62

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 0.94 0.94

Staples Advantage 1 EA 7.35 7.35

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 88 Pens, Gel, med. pt. 10/ipk, asst. colors, retr.” =
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 579 579

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 5.93 5.93

Staples Advantage 1 EA 6.04 6.04

Baker Office Products 1 EA 6.79 6.79

Hester?s Office Fumiture and 1 EA 87 8.7

School Specialty 1 EA 9.38 9.38

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 89 Pens, Gel, fine pt., 12/bx, Black1C
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 7.94 7.94

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA 8.14 8.14

Staples Advantage 1 EA 8.29 8.29




School Specialty 1 EA 8.63 863

Baker Office Products 1 EA 8.69 8.69

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 87 8.7

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 90 Pens, Gel, fine pt., 12/bx, Red[i[!
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 7.94 7.94

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 8.14 8.14

Staples Advantage 1 EA 8.29 8.29

School Specialty 1 EA 8.63 8.63

Baker Office Products 1EA 8.89 §.69

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 8.7 8.7

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid
!Gne 91 Pens, Gel, fine pt., 12/bx, Blue.
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 7.94 7.94

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 8.14 8.14

Staples Advantage 1 EA 8.29 8.29

Schoo! Specialty 1 EA 8.63 8.63

Baker Office Products 1EA 8.69 8.69

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA 8.7 87

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid
{Line 92 Pens, Pilot Precise Grip, 12/bx, Black: i iPens, Pilot Precise Grip, 12/bx, Red: Pens, Pilot Precise Grip, 12
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 1.56 1.56

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 12.29 12.29

Baker Office Products 1EA 13.09 13.09

Staples Advantage 1 EA 19.32 19.32

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA Ne Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

|Line 93 Pens, Pilot Precise Grip, 12/bx, Green. : Pens, Pilot Precise Grip, 12/bx, Purple
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Baker Gffice Products 1EA 13.09 13.09

Staples Advaniage 1 EA 20.28 20.28

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Schoo! Specialty 1 EA No Bid




Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1EA NoBid
[Line 94 Power Strip, 4 ft., 6 output0
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1EA 6.98 6.98

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 6.99 6.99

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1 EA 4.M 4.01 BID-99000 FELLOWESOO6 OUTLET, 4 FT CORD
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1EA 4.14 414 KENSINGTON POWER STRIPS
|Line 95 Scissors, 8" Straight, plastic handle, lightweight: ' .
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1EA 0.42 0.42

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 0.57 0.57

Staples Advantage 1EA 0.66 0.66

QUILL CORPQORATION 1 EA 0.78 0.78

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 1.82 1.82

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc i EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

[Line 96 Scissors, Blunt Tip, 5 inch.
Name QTY LUOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.39 0.39

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 0.39 0.39

School Specialty 1 EA 0.93 0.93

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 18 18

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.95 195

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA No Bid

[Line 97 Sheet Protector, letter, non-glare, 50/bx= =
Name QTY LOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.68 1.68

School Speciaity 1 EA 2147 2147

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 2.59 2.59

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 3.22 3.22

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 4 4B 4.46




S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 2.21 2.21 LEGACY SHEET PROTECTORS
|Line 98 Spiral Notebooks, 4/pk, Asst. colors:i_]
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 2.05 2.05

Baker Office Products 1EA 2.99 2.99

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Fumiture and - 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
|Line 99 Staple Remover, Jaw StyleS T
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.21 0.21

School Specialty 1 EA 0.25 0.25

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 0.29 0.29

Hester?s Office Fumniture and 1EA 0.35 0.35

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Al 1) 1EA 0.26 0.26 UNIVERSAL STAPLE REMOVERS
[Line 100 Stapler, Full Strip, Black -
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA 213 213

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 2.52 2.52

Staples Advantage 1 EA 2.63 263

Baker Office Products 1 EA 273 273

School Specialty 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 101 Staples, Standard
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 0.45 0.45

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 0.49 0.49

Baker Office Products 1EA 0.52 0.52

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 0.53 0.53

School Specialty 1 EA 0.57 0.57

Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.69 0.69




S & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid
[Line 102 Surge Protector, 10 ft., 6 output Clamp-onC(
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA 12.57 12.57

Staples Advantage 1 EA 16.69 16.69

School Specialty 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 28.81 28.81 BELKIN CLAMP ON SURGE PROTECTOR
[Line 103 Tape, Box sealing, 2" clear, 3M_"
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 3.66 3.66

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 3.83 383

Baker Office Products 1 EA 3.89 3.89

School Specialty 1 EA 417 417

Staples Advantage 1 EA 8.01 8.01

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simen Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 104 Tape, Masking 1"00
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA 1.07 1.07

Staples Advantage 1EA 11 1.1

School Specialty 1EA 1.1 1.11

Baker Office Products 1 EA 1.18 1.19

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 315 315

S & S Worldwide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 105 Tape Dispenser, 1" core, Black_ =
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.81 0.81

School Specialty 1 EA 0.89 0.89

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 1.15 1.15

Hester?s Office Fumiture and 1 EA 1.21 1.21

S & S Worldwide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid




Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 0.94 0.94 UNIVERSAL TAPE DISPENSERS
[Line 106 Tape, Desktop refill, 3/4*-12/pkgOL
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1EA 2.2 2.2

Staples Advantage 1 EA 5.87 5.87

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA 7.57 7.57

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 2112 21.12

Baker Cffice Products 1 EA 2349 23.49

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA 23.76 23.76

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid
[Line 107 Tape, Cotrection, White[: !
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.59 0.59

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 1.5 1.5

Baker Office Products 1 EA 1.74 1.74

Hester?s Office Furniture and . 1 EA 1.84 1.84

School Specialty t EA 1.87 1.87

8 & S WorldWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid
[Line 108 Bags, Paper Lunch, 100 count( |
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1EA 5.59 5.59

Staples Advantage 1 EA 767 7.67

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA NoBid

[Line 109 Bags, Paper Luncht:__
Name QTY UQOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
School Specialty 1 EA 5.59 5.59

Staples Advantage 1 EA 7.67 7.67

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATICN 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid




[Line 110

Bags, Qt. Zipper, 100 count(1!

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 7.9 7.9

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Al 1) 1EA 22.86 22 86 BID-1QSL250001180OLD 150/CASENTSLIDER STORAGE BAG, QT SIZE
[Line 111 Bags, Gallon zipper, 100 count .-
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 10.97 10.97

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldwWide 1EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1) 1EA 22.86 22.86 BID-1QSL15000150/CASENNISLIDER STORAGE BAGS, GALLON
ILine 142 Balloons, 4", 12 count_L
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Speciaity 1 Bag 0.8 0.8

Staples Advantage 1 Bag 112 1.12

S & S WorldWide 1 Bag 33 33

Simon Marketing Inc 1 Bag NoBid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 Bag NoBid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 Bag NoBid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 Bag NoBid

Baker Office Products 1 Bag No Bid

[Line 113 Craft Stick, Jumbo, 500/bx;
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1 EA 3.36 3.36

S & S WorldWide 1EA 34 34

Staples Advantage 1EA 3.85 3.95

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid




[Line 114

Craft Sticks, Reg., 1000/bx :C

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

S & S WorldWide 1EA 2.4 2.4

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA 3 3

School Specialty 1 EA 3.25 3.25

Staples Advantage 1 EA 3.26 3.26

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA  NoBid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid
fLine 115 Cups, 8 oz Styrofoam, 50 count=5
Name QTY UCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.93 0.93

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

5 & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

BRaker Office Products 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 1 ¢csM00 15 15 SS #1322712

QUILL CORPORATION (Alt 1} 1EA 17.73 17.73 BID-8J8, DART FOAM CUP 80Z.0NSOLD 1,000/CASE
[Line 116 Cups, 9 oz. Plastic, 50 count!i_
Name QTY UOCM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Staples Advantage 1 EA 423 423

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simen Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

[Line 117 Modeling Clay, 4 oz. each, red, yellow, blue and green: .i:
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

School Specialty 1 EA 0.83 0.83

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.98 1.98

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 2 2

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

[Line 118

Plates, 8" paper, 100 count™ ™~




Name QTY UOM LUnit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.19 1.19

S & S WorldWide 1 EA 3.1 31

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Cffice Products 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1) 1 cs/1001 g9 9 85 #1322700

fLine 119 Plates, 9" paper, 100 count_C
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION 1EA 1.67 1.67

Staples Advantage 1 EA 1.76 1.76

S & S WorldWide 1EA 4.15 4.15

Simon Marketing Inc 1EA No Bid

Baker Office Products 1EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1EA No Bid

Scheol Specialty (Alt 1) 1 cs/120 16.56 16.56 S5 #1322701
iLine 120 Playdough! |7

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

Hester?s Office Furniture and - 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing Inc 1 EA Ne Bid

Staples Advantage 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

[Line 121 Rubber Bands, asst. sz #54, 1/4 b |
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Staples Advantage 1 EA 0.41 0.41

School Specialty 1 EA 0.53 0.53

Hester?s Office Furniture and 1 EA 0.66 0.66

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid

S & S WorldWide 1 EA No Bid

Simon Marketing inc 1 EA No Bid

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. 1 EA No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 EA 0.69 0.69 LEGACY 1/4LB #54 RUBBER BANDS
[Line 122 Wanxed Paper, 75 sq. ft.” 0
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid



