FOREST LAKE AREA SCHOOLS
Forest Lake, MN 55025

May 16, 2013
PAPER SUPPLIES
2013 - 2014
Item/s Supplier Amount
1 Wilcox Paper $ 620.00
2-4 Standard Stationery Supply Co. 3 1,183.50
5 School Specialty $ 522.75
6-34 Pyramid School Products $ 4,471.25
35-38 Pyramid School Products $ 291.60
39-47 C. J. Duffey $ 22,795.20
48-49 C. J. Duffey $ 48,102.80
50 Not Bid No Bid
51 Not Bid No Bid
52-62 Pyramid School Products $ 1,188.63
63-66 Pyramid School Products $ 1,926.50
67 Pyramid School Products $ 852.00
68-76 C. J. Duffey $ 3,876.65
77-79 Office Depot 3 191.35
TOTAL $ 86,022.23
C. J. Duffey 3 74,774.65
Office Depot $ 191.35
Pyramid School Products $ 8,729.98
Schoot Specialty 3 522.75
Standard Stationery Supply Co. $ 1,183.50
Wilcox Paper $ 620.00
TOTAL $ §6,022.23
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INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT #831
Forest Lake, MN 55025

May 16, 2013

PAPER SUPPLIES
2013 - 2014

* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey Office ** Pyramid School School Specialty
Group Paper Company Depot Products
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED || PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.{Envelopes #10, Plain, 500 Per Box, 5 Box Per Cs. White 100 l Boxes $ 7291% 729.00 | No Bid | No Bid $ 74618 746.00 1| $ 6.651% 6650018 7.33]% 733.00
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 1 $ 729.00 No Bid $ 746.00 | Ampad $ 665.00 $ 733.00
#63, 6-1/2 x 9-1/2, 28 Ib. Stock,
2.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per Case Manila 90 Boxes $ 53318% 479.70 Jl No Bid | No Bid $ 5521% 496.80 1 $ 48313 434.7011$ 520(5% 468.00
#90, 9 x 12, 28 Ib. Stock,
3.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case Manila 100 Boxes $ 6.151 8% 615.00 | No Bid | No Bid $ B65719% 657.00 || 517 1% 517.001%$ 594(% 594.00
#97, 10 x 13, 28 Ib. Stock,
4. Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case Manila 40 Boxes 11§ 7.181% 287.20 }i No Bid | No Bid $ 79313 317201 $ 6.07 |3 24280118 74413 297.60
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 2 - 4 $ 1,381.90 No Bid $ 1,471.00 || Ampad $ 1,194.50 $ 1,359.60
5.{Paper, Blanks, Plain 6 Ply, 22 x 28, 100 Sht Per Package White l I 25 l Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 31.88 797.00 || No Bid No Bid $ 209118 522.75
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 5 No Bid No Bid $ 797.00 No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
6.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Black 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $4098 1% 409.801 $ 25.00 | $ 250001 % 2950 )% 295.00
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
7.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Blue 5 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 408213 204101 § 2350 |3 11750|$ 2750($ 137.50
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
8.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Blue 0 Cases i No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4229153 - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
9.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Light Blue 0 Cases |l No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $41891% - 3 - $ - § - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
10.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Brown 5 Cases |l No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $414318 207151 $ 2500 1% 125.001% 30.00|$ 150.00
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
11.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Gray 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 408213 - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, Brilliant
12.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Green 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $41.021% - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
13.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Green 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 40821 % - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
14.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Orange 0 Cases |l No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $41531(% - 3 - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
15.[Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Pink 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $415418 - $ - $ - 3 - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
16.iPaper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Scarlet 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 408283 - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
17.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Violet 5 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $41941% 209.701 $ 23501% 117.560{$ 27508 137.50
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Standard Stationery Supply Co.

Wilcox Paper

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.{Envelopes #10, Plain, 500 Per Box, 5 Box PerCs. 1% 66018 660.00 1 § 62013 620.00
Qualit
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 1 earc $ 660.00
#63, 6-1/2 x 9-1/2, 28 Ib. Stock,
2.1Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per Case $ 479 1% 4311011 $ 11501 $ 1,035.00
#90, 9 x 12, 28 Ib. Stock,
3.1Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case $ 512 1% 51200 $ 13.30 1 8§ 1,330.00
#97, 10 x 13, 28 Ib. Stock,
4.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case $ 6.01 24040 ' $ 16201 % 648.00
Quatit
LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 2- 4 = $ 3,013.00
5.|Paper, Blanks, Plain 6 Ply, 22 x 28, 100 Sht Per Package No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 5 No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
6.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x12, Groundwood Fibre,
7.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
8.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
9.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
10.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
11.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
12.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case |} No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
13.[Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
14.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
15.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
16.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
17.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey Office ** Pyramid School School Specialty
Group Paper Company Depot Products
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, Bright
18.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case White 50 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 41121 % 2,056.00 28.001% 1400.0011$ 300018 1,500.00
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
19.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Yellow 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $41.041 9% 410.40 23501 $ 2350018 275018 275.00
12 x 18, Groundwood Fibre,
20.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Black 15 Cases | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 405618 608.40 24751 % 371.251% 29004% 435.00
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
21.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Blue 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $419718% 419.70 22501 % 2250013 265013 265.00
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
22.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Dark Blue 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 42101 $ 421.00 24751 % 247.501% 29.001% 290.00
12 x 18 Groundwoad Fibre,
23.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | Light Blue 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4056 | § - - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
24.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Brown 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4056 | % - - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
25.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Brown 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4056 1 3% - - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
26.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Gray 5 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4056 1% 202,80 22501 % 112.501$ 26501} $ 132.50
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre, Brilliant
27.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg,25 Pkgs Per Case Green 15 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $4085]% 612.75 22501% 337.501% 26501% 397.50
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
28.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Orange 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4056 1% 405.60 27251 % 272.5051$ 32501 % 325.00
12'x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
29.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Pink 5 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $41.581% 207.90 225018 1125018 26501 % 132.50
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
30.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Red 5 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 40581 % 202.90 28251 % 141.251$ 34251 8% 171.25
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
31.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Scarlet 5 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $405618 202.80 27251% 136.25}$ 32751% 163.76
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
32.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Violet 0 Cases |l No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 426618 - - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre, Bright
33.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case White 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4068 | % 406.80 27.00 1% 2700018 29751 % 297.50
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
34.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Yellow 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 40968 - - - 3 -
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 6 - 34 NO BID NO BID $ 7,187.80 APC $ 510500
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Standard Stationery Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,

18.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,

19.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18, Groundwood Fibre,

20.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

21.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

22.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

23.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

24 . |Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

25 [Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

26.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

27.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg,25 Pkygs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

28.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

29.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

30.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

31.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case } No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

32.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

33.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

34.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 6 - 34 No Bid No bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey Office ** Pyramid School School Specialty
Group Paper Company Depot Products
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
35.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $51291% - $ - -
36.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 487718 - $ - -
37.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 ib. White 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 5375189 - $ - -
38.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. White 10 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 5053 1% 505.30 || $ 29.16 342.80
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 35-38 NO BID NO BID $ 505.30 *APC 342.80
39.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Blue 80 Cases $ 31731% 2,5384011% 3166 (% 26328011 $ 4684 | $ 3,747.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
40.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case Canary 160 Cases $ 31731% 5076.80}$ 316613 5065601$ 46841 3 7,494.40 § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
41.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case Gold 80 Cases $ 31731% 2,538401% 31661 % 253280 $ 4684 | $ 3,747.20 il No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42.1Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case Green 120 Cases $ 31731% 3,80760% 3166 [$ 3,799.2011$ 4684 1 3% 5,620.80 ji No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2x 11, 20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case Pink 120 Cases $ 3173183 3,807601 % 3166 1% 3,799.201$ 4684 | § 5,620.80 |l No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44.iPaper, As Per Spec 8-1/2x 11,20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case Salmon 40 Cases $ 317318 1,269.20 1§ 3166 | $ 1,266.40 1 $ 4684 | § 1,873.60 i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Buff 40 Cases $ 317318 1,2692011 % 3166 % 1,266.4011$ 4684 1% 1,873.60 jl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Orchid 80 Cases $ 31731% 2,5384011$ 3166 1% 26328015 4684 1% 3,747.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 14, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Green 0 Cases $ - $ - $ - $ 46841 % - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 39 - 47 FASCOPY | $ 22,845.60 || Torchgiow 3 33,724.80 No Bid No Bid
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
48.1Specs. #4,8-1/2x 11, 20 ib. White 2120 Cases $ 22841% 48,420.80 115 22691 3% 48,102.80 1% 32171 $ 68,200.40 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
49.|Specs. #4, 8-1/2 x 14, 20 |b. White 0 Cases $ - 3 - $ - $ - $ 4467 1% - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 48 - 49 (See Instructions to Bidders for Specifications) FASCOPY | § 48,420.80 || FRP 928 $ 68,200.40 No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11 - 1/2" Writing Line With a 1/4"
Broken Line and a 1/4" space Between
Writing Lines. The Following is acceptable:
Pacon Corp. #2639 -- SEE SAMPLE
50.|Paper, Manuscript ATTACHED. 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $32141 % - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 50 No Bid No Bid $ - No Bid No Bid
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Standard Stationery Supply Co.

Wilcox Paper

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
35.1Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 1b. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37.{Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 35-38 No Bid No Bid
39.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 32501% 2,600.00
40.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11,20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 3250 | $ 5,200.00
41.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 325018 2,600.00
42.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 3250189 3,900.00
43.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 32501 % 3,900.00
44 |Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2x 11,20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 32501% 1,300.00
45.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 32501 9% 1,300.00
46.1Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2x 11, 20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 32501 % 2,600.00
47.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 14, 20 ib., 10 Rms Per Case No Bid No Bid $ - $ -
Boise
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 39 - 47 No Bid Fireworx 3 23,400.00
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
48.1Specs. #4,8-1/2x 11,20 1b. No Bid No Bid $ 2315183 49,078.00
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
49.|Specs. #4,8-1/2x 14, 20 1b. No Bid No Bid $ - $ -
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 48 - 49 (See Instructions to Bidders for Specificaj No Bid Boise $ 49,078.00
8-1/2 x 11 - 1/2" Wiriting Line With a 1/4"
Broken Line and a 1/4" space Between
Writing Lines. The Following is acceptable:
Pacon Corp. #2639 — SEE SAMPLE
50.{Paper, Manuscript ATTACHED, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 50 No Bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey Office ** Pyramid School School Speclaity
Group Paper Company Depot Products
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
51.|Paper, Mounting Board 22 x 28, 14-Ply, 50 Sheets Per Pkg White 0 Pkgs No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 129915 - No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 51 No Bid No Bid $ - No Bid No Bid
52.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Black 8 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 47761 % 382.08 i § 2576 | 2060818% 272619 218.08
53.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Blue 7 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 591018 4137011 & 242518 169.7541 % 2517 1% 176.19
54.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Dark Brown 3 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4610 | $ 138.30 | $ 23551 % 70651 % 300619 90.18
55.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Green 5 Rolis No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $61.731% 308651 $ 22451% 1122511 % 2877 1% 143.85
56.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 1b., Bases Weight Orange 3 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 5736198 172081 % 28191% 845711 40.001$ 120.00
57.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Pink 2 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 546318 109.26 || $ 267918 53581% 36721% 73.44
58.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Red 0 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $645218% - $ - $ - $ - $ -
59.[Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 1b., Bases Weight Scarlet 0 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 5012 1% - $ - $ - $ - $ -
60.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000 L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Sky Blue 2 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 59.26 1'% 118.52 11 § 27.69 1% 55.38 1% 38.911% 77.82
61.[Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight White 9 Rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 4226 1% 3803413 23251% 209.2511$ 2404 1 § 216.36
62.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Yellow 8 Rolis No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $6204 1% 4963211 $ 283918 2271241% 383318 306.64
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 62 - 62 No Bid No Bid $ 2,519.25 *APC $ 1,422.56
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Standard Stationery Supply Co.

Wilcox Paper

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
51.{Paper, Mounting Board 22 x 28, 14-Ply, 50 Sheets Per Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 51 No Bid No Bid
52.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
53.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
61.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
62.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 52 - 62 No Bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey Office ** Pyramid School School Specialty
Group Paper Company Depot Products
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9x12, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
63.|Paper, Tagboard 12 Pkgs/Case Manila 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 453318 - 3 - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18,150 Tb., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
64.|Paper, Tagboard 10 Pkgs/Case Manila 50 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid 3426118 2,130501 % 23.041% 1,152.0041$% 2998 (% 1,499.00
65.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg Manila 0 Pkgs No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 2567 |8 - $ - $ - $ - $ -
66.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg White 50 Pkgs No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $273119% 1,365.50 | § 1549 | § 774501 % 1590 1% 795.00
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 63 - 66 No Bid No Bid $ 3,496.00 *APC $ 2,294.00
Red Lined, Left Margin,
67.|Paper, Theme (holeless)  |3/8" Ruled, 8-1/2x 11 (NOT 3 Hole) White 40 Cases || No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 340818 1,363.20 | $ 21.30{$ 852.001$ 25901%$ 1,036.00
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 67 No Bid No Bid $ 1,363.20 $ “1$ 1,036.00
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
68.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Blue 14 Cases $ 326219 45668 || $ 30.25 | $ 423501% 346918 485.66 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
69.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Canary 19 Cases $ 32628 619.78 1| $ 30251 8 574751 % 34981 % 664.62 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib,, 250 Sheets Per
70.1Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Goldenrod 20 Cases $§ 326213 65240 11$ 30251 9% 605.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
71.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Gray 8 Cases $ 3262198 26096 11$ 30251 % 2420011 $ 63351 8% 506.80 it No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
72.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Green 17 Cases $ 326218 554.54 | $ 30.251 % 5142513 346118 588.37 Ii No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 ib., 250 Sheets Per
73.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case lvory 9 Cases $ 32621% 29358 ||$ 3025 | § 272.251% 3430 | § 308.70 i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
74.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Pink 13 Cases $ 32621!% 42406 1% 30251 $ 303.251$ 3420 % 44460 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
75.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Tan 13 Cases $ 326218 424.06 113 30251 % 3932518 - $ - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
76.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case White 16 Cases $ 31.051% 49680 | $ 28.65 $33141% 530.24 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Did not
Neenah or | bid on
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 68 - 76 Equal $ 4,182.86 || Domtar llall items | § 3,528.99 No Bid No Bid




Standard Stationery Supply Co.

Wilcox Paper

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9x12, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
63.{Paper, Tagboard 12 Pkgs/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
64.|Paper, Tagboard 10 Pkgs/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66.]Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 63 - 66 No Bid No Bid
Red Lined, Left Margin,
67.|Paper, Theme (holeless) 3/8" Ruled, 8-1/2 x 11 (NOT 3 Hole) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 67 No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
68.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 276018 386.40
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
69.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 27601 % 524.40
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
70.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ - No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
71.1Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ - No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
72.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 276018 469.20
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
73.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 276018 248.40
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
74.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 27601% 358.80
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
75.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ - No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
76.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid $ 2760183 441.60
Did not
bid on
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 68 - 76 No Bid all items $ 2,428.80

BIDSHT
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All other bidders submitted a bid security.

* CPG - Contract Paper Group - 20 case per order minimum for free shipping.

Full truck load = 840 cases/21 pallets
Envelopes - items 1,2,3, & 4 - minimum order of 50 cins.
No driver help on unloading, must be done by district.

**Pyramid School Products - APC - American Paper Company

Minimum order $4,000 full cases. Any combo of items in full cases.

BIDSHT
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey Office ** Pyramid School School Specialty
Group Paper Company Depot Products
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED

ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
77 .|Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17, 20 Ib. White 4 Cases $ 35001% 140.00 || No Bid | No Bid $ 352118 140.84 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78.|Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17, 20 Ib. Blue 0 Cases $ - $ - No Bid | No Bid $505118% - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79.|Paper, Xerographic 11x17,20 b, Gold 1 Cases $ 5400189 54.00 | No Bid | No Bid $ 505118 50.51 |l No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 77 - 79 FASCOPY | 8§ 194.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 cs min.




BIDSHT

Standard Stationery Supply Co.

Wilcox Paper

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
77.|Paper, Xerographic 11x 17,20 1b. No Bid No Bid $ 272518 109.00
78.|Paper, Xerographic 11x17,20 b, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79.{Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17,20 1b. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Did not
bid on
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 77 - 79 No Bid all items $ 109.00

All other bidders submitted a bid security.

* CPG - Contract Paper Group - 20 case per order minimum for free shipping.
Full truck load = 840 cases/21 pallets
Envelopes - items 1,2,3, & 4 - minimum order of 50 ctns.
No driver help on unloading, must be done by district.

**Pyramid School Products - APC - American Paper Company
Minimum order $4,000 full cases. Any combo of items in full cases.

Page 12




