DENTON ISD Projectors RFP121211

Tabulation

Communication Concepts Computer Tech Delcom - Option 1 Delcom - Option 2 Pathway Communications
Price Brand Price Brand Price Brand Price Brand Price Brand
Ceiling Mount Projector and
Install $ 2,229.00 Dukane 8930 $ 1,787.00 NEC M311X | $ 1,570.00 Epson 905 | $ 1,569.90 | NEC NP-M311X | $ 1,392.10 | NEC M311X
Ultra-Short throw projector and
Install $ 2,297.00 Dukane 8112 $ 1,868.00 NEC U300X | $ 962.00 | Epson475w | $ 1,795.80 NEC NP-U300X | $ 924.88 | NP U300X
Single Projector to Use as Hot
Swap $ 718.00 1 free per campus M311X $ 577.20 |905 Powerlight | $867.30 / $641.40 M311X / U300X| $ 812.32 | NEC M311X
Bulb Replacement Cost $ 315.00 $199 / $209 $ 91.90 $ 244.30 M311X | $ 291.98
Bulb Life 5,000 / 4,000 10,000/ 3,000 3,000 - 6,000 5,000 - 10,000 Up to 5000 Hrs
Bulb Warranty 5,000 / 4,000 1 year 90 day lyr 1 Year or 500 Hrs
Projector Warranty 5 year 3 years 2 year 2 year 2 years
Lumens of Projector Being
Proposed 3200/ 3000 3200/ 3000 $ 3,000.00 $ 3,100.00 $ 3,100.00
*Negotiated Pricing
Price Per Campus: Below
Guyer High School $  226,005.00 $ 184,134.00 $ 155,359.40 $ 155,359.40 $ 149,810.29 | $ 150,133.09
Crownover Middle School $ 138,569.00 $ 113,436.00 $ 96,670.00 $ 100,443.20 $ 92,009.87 $92,171.27
Navo Middle School $ 129,584.00 $ 101,851.00 $ 87,274.80 $ 90,702.00 $ 86,752.53 | $ 86,913.93
Total Turnkey Project Cost $  494,158.00 $ 399,421.00 $ 339,304.20 $ 346,504.60 $ 328,572.69 | $ 329,218.29
*over budget *over budget *Originally submitted
pricing for a M300X
short throw projector.
After committee review
Total Cost for Alternate A Denotn ISD asked for
(Encoders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |ultra short throw
Total Cost for Alternate B Free for RFP with
(Licenses) $129 per Dongle free stylus No Bid No Bid
Will provide 1 M311X per each of the three campuses as a
IP Configuration,Reprogramming, or the completion of hot swap for no additonal charge
the Teacher;s Workstation - $85 per hour

Remove existing screen and replace - $265 each

Additional Materials Section with several misc charges

Provide and install supplemental Amplified Speaker
System - $693 per room

Assumes all screens and mounting hardware provided by district; assumes teacher circuit accessible w/in 35' for
electrical; for all swaps assumes all mounting hardware in good working order and reusable

Install new BerTek Cat 5 Data Drop from closet to new
video projector - $289 each




