BID RECOMMENDATION

Electric Bus

This proposal is for the purchase of electric buses and charging stations that will be
utilized by our Transportation Department and is effective March 29, 2023 through
March 28, 2024 and will automatically be extended for two (2) years in one (1)
year increment to allow for the manufacturing of the buses. The district will
purchase ten (buses) and five (5) charging stations.

I RECOMMEND ACCEPTING THE PROPOSAL OF LONGHORN BUS
SALES AS THE BEST VALUE FOR THE DISTRICT.

Amount Budgeted — $9,875,000.00
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Supplier Participation
23-24-02-161 Addendum 1

Electric Bus

Issue Date: 1/26/2023
Questions Deadline: 2/3/2023 05:00 PM (CT)
Response Deadline: 2/16/2023 02:00 PM (CT)

Participation Summary

Supplier

2BS Tools

AJL International (Accent/Johnston Limousine, Inc.)
Ampcontrol Technologies, Inc.

AngelTrax (IVS, Inc)

Arbuckle Enterprises

BizReps

BLDZ Enterprise LLC

BP Pulse Fleet North America Inc

Bus Parts Warehouse (Dencompany LLC)
Cap-A-Bus, Inc. (C.A.B. Fleet Refinishing)
Carquest (Straus Frank Ent)

Cintas-Education (Cintas Corporation No.2)
competitive choice

Creative Bus Sales, Inc.

Dannys Transmissions

Don Ringler Automotive Group Inc.

Easy Way Safety Services, INC

Education Logistics, Inc. (Education Logistics, Inc.)

First Student (First Student, Inc.)

Email Status
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Response Status

No Response
No Response
Submitted
Viewed

No Response
Unsubmitted
No Response
Submitted
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
Unsubmitted
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response

No Response
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Ford Motor Company DBA Ford Pro Charging

Gatekeeper Systems USA Inc (Gatekeeper Systems USA Inc)

Gerber Collision & Glass

Heavy Duty Bus Parts Inc.

Highland Electric Fleets

Humble ISD

Inpax Shipping Solutions

Interstate All Battery Center (Washburn Industries)
Interstate Business Solutions (Interstate & Associates Inc)
Jasper Engines and Transmissions

JPS Contracting and House Moving LLC

KLC Video Security (KLC Custom Electronics, LLC)
LDV, Inc (LDV, Inc)

LONGHORN BUS SALES

Longhorn International Trucks

Master's Transportation Inc. (Goodbrake Master's Transportation Inc.)

National Guaranteed Vinyl, Inc.

OK TOURS

One Stop Bus Stop, Inc. (The Bus Stop)

OpenText (OpenText)

Penske Truck leasing

Planet Cellular Inc (Planet Cellular Inc)

R.C. Tway Co. / dba Kentucky Trailer (Kentucky Trailer)
Rainbow Printing (Plasticards, Inc)

Riley National Supply and Transport

Roger Beasley Auto Glass (Roger Beasley Collision Centers LTD)

Rush Bus Center San Antonio Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP)

Rush Truck Center Waco (Rush Enterprises)
S&B USA

Sam's Limousine and Transportation, Inc.
Scovis Productions DBA (Kevin M. Scott)
SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC

Submitted
No Response
No Response
No Response
Submitted
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
Submitted
No Response
Submitted
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response
Submitted
No Response
Viewed

No Response
Viewed

No Response

23-24-02-161 - Page 3 of 6



Southwest Bus Sales

Star Shuttle & Charter (Star Shuttle, Inc.)
TEMPLE BOLT & SUPPLY

Texas Alternator Starter Svc (McAdams Group, LLC)
The Lion Electric Co. USA Inc.

The Travel Firm

THOMAS BUS GULF COAST GP INC
Tint World (Rawlins Motor Works Inc)

TJ Qilfield Services

Tri City Bicycles, LLC.

Vital Care Family Practice

Washing Texas LLC

Wells Glass & Mirror

External Invitation Summary

Fail

Fail

No Bid

No Response
No Response
No Response
Viewed

No Response
Submitted
Viewed

No Response
No Response
No Response
No Response

No Response

Invite Email
alexw@phoenixmotorcars.com Yes
chayes@shikunusa.com Yes
dimitri.brown@highlandfleets.c  Yes
om

mtroy@ford.com Yes
wonmoon@ampcontrol.io Yes

2/6/2023

2/13/2023

2/1/2023

2/1/2023

Auto Approve Invitation Date Email Status

2/1/2023

Status

Invitation
Sent

Approve
d

Approve
d

Approve
d

Approve
d
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Status Date

2/1/2023

2/6/2023

2/14/2023

2/1/2023

2/1/2023
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Killeen Independent School District
Bid Tabulation
Electric Bus
RFP# 23-24-02-161
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100 25 15 15 15 20 5 5 0 0
Longhorn Bus Sales 1 90.75 21.00 15.00 15.00 13.75 20.00 1.00 5.00 0.00 0.00
Rush Bus Center San Antonio 2 75.25 21.50 12.50 11.25 13.00 15.00 0.00 2.00 0.00 0.00
Thomas Bus Gulf Coast GP, Inc. 3 74.75 20.75 12.50 11.25 13.25 15.00 0.00 2.00 0.00 0.00
BP Pulse Fleet North America 4 72.75 19.00 13.75 8.75 13.75 17.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Ford Motor Company 5 68.25 18.50 12.50 8.75 12.50 15.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Master's Tranpsportation 6 67.25 20.50 12.50 7.50 11.75 15.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Ampcontrol Technologies, Inc. 7 64.75 19.75 10.00 7.50 12.00 12.50 3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Highland Electric Fleets 8 64.25 16.75 11.25 7.50 13.25 12.50 3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
72.25 19.72 12.50 9.69 12.91 15.31 1.00 113 0.00 0.00



Electric Bus RFP# 23-24-02-161
Bus & Charging Station Price

Price per bus

Supplier QTY Unit Price
Master's Transportation Inc. (Goodbrake Master's Transportation Inc.) 1 $375,000.00
THOMAS BUS GULF COAST GP INC 1 $379,995.00
Rush Bus Center San Antonio Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP) 1 $384,305.00
LONGHORN BUS SALES 1 $393,295.00
Ford Motor Company DBA Ford Pro Charging 1 No Bid
Ampcontrol Technologies, Inc. 1 No Bid
Highland Electric Fleets 1 No Bid
60kW DC Fast Charging Station

Supplier QTY Unit Price
BP Pulse Fleet North America Inc 1 $27,265.00
THOMAS BUS GULF COAST GP INC 1 $28,000.00
Ampcontrol Technologies, Inc. 1 $29,900.00
Ford Motor Company DBA Ford Pro Charging 1 $33,457.80
Rush Bus Center San Antonio Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP) 1 $37,656.00
[ALT1] Master's Transportation Inc. (Goodbrake Master's Transportation Inc.) 1 $42,248.00
LONGHORN BUS SALES 1 $44,726.00
Highland Electric Fleets 1 $47,200.00
[ALT1] Rush Bus Center San Antonio Number 2 (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP) 1 $418,960.00
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