CSP 150709 Fresh Produce

Total Walnut
Ranking Criteria Possible | Brothers Hardies | creek
Points | Produce | Castle Produce | Produce | Farm TX
Purchase Price 40 40 37 38 39
Is the price per unit within the budget?
Were all items quoted? No No
Reputation of the vendor and vendor's goods or services 10 10 | 9 10 10
Does the proposer have good references?
Listed 1 district 3

Does the proposer have comparable education customers? times with different
Were delivery schedules kept?
Are delivery trucks refrigerated? No
Quality of the vendor's goods or services 20 20 | 19 20 20
Is the proposer able to supply locally grown (within 100 miles) products?
Is the proposer able to supply Texas grown products?
Did delivered items meet expected shelf life. No
Extent to which the goods or services meet the district's needs 15 15 13 14 15
Does the proposer have the ability to deliver to all locations?

Cannot meet the
Can the proposer meet the districts delivery schedule? Monday delivery
Does the proposer have the ability to provide both Conventionally and Not all
Organically Grown products? Not all items items
Vendor's past relationship with the district 3 3 | 2 3 3
Has the district had any bad experiences with the proposer? Quality
HUB Certified 2 o | 0 0 0
Is the proposer recognized as a Historically Underutilized Business?
Long Term cost to the district 5 4 | 2 3 4
Does the proposer offer an automated system for ordering and tracking
purposes? Yes No Yes No
Were all items quoted with requested Unit of Measure (UM)? No No No Yes
Did proposer bid all produce requested? Yes No No Yes
Other Relevant factors 5 5 | 0 5 5
Does the proposer have a HACCP program? (Hazard Analysis & Critical
Control Points program) HACCP No HACCP HACCP
Total Points 100 97 82 93 96




CSP 150709 Fresh Produce

Unit of Price adjusted Unit of Price adjust.ed Unit of Price adjust'ed Walnut

Item Conventionally Grown Bid Unit of Brother Measure to match bid Castle Meas_ure tg match bid Hardies Meas.ure tq match bid Creek Farm

No. Product Description Measure (UM) | Produce Submitted | Unit of Measure Produce Submitted |Unit of Measure Produce | Submitted [Unit of Measure X

UM M) UM) M) M) UM)
1 |Apples, Gala, Whole 138 ct/cs $24.15|138 ct/cs $33.00{ 138 ct $30.52| 138 ct $30.00
2 | Apples, Sliced, Packaged 100-20z/cs $23.25|100-20z $0.00|No Bid $27.00(100 ct $40.00
3 |Bananas 40 1b/cs $16.25|401b $27.50(40 Ib $22.10(401b $20.00
4 |Carrots, Baby, Whole 51b/bg $5.78|51b $8.00(5 Ib $6.25(5 Ib $6.25
5 |Celery, Sticks 51b/bg $6.95|51b $10.00(5 Ib $6.75|5 Ib $8.50
6 |Cucumbers, Whole Pound $0.50|11b $1.00|By the pound $3.99|5 b $0.80 $0.80
7 |Grapes, Red, Seedless 22 Ib/lug $23.50(|221b $31.50{18 Ib/lug $38.50 $28.90(22 Ib $32.00
8 |Lettuce/Romaine, Chopped |5 1b/bg $2.99(2 Ib/bg $7.48 $12.50(5Ib $3.75|2 1b $9.38 $9.95
9 |Orange, Whole 88 ct/cs $22.01(88 ct $30.00(88 ct $24.00|88 ct $26.00
10 |Strawberries Flat $16.25|8x11b $29.50|Flat $23.00(81 pt $18.50
11 |Tomatoes, Whole 5x6 - 2 layer/cs $14.25|5x6- 2 layer $25.00|5x6 2 layer cs $20.92|20 Ib $20.00
12 |Tomatoes, Cherry Pint $1.65|Pint $2.50|Pint $2.75/|Pint $2.00
TOTAL $157.53 $162.02 $210.50 $217.50 $199.93 $202.36 $214.00
. Price adjusted . Price adjusted . Price adjusted
Item | Organically Grown Product | Bid Unit of Brother Unit of to matcil bid Castle Unit of to mathh bid Hardies Unit of to matgh bid Walnut

A Measure . Measure . Measure . Creek Farm

No. Description Measure Produce Submitted Unit of Measure Produce Submitted Unit of Measure Produce Submitted Unit of Measure X

M) (UM) M)

1 |Apples, Gala, Whole 138 ct/cs $38.65|138 ct/cs $66.00|138 ct $48.00|138 ct/401b $42.00
2 | Apples, Sliced, Packaged 100-20z/cs $34.73]100-20z $0.00|No Bid $39.00{100 ct $60.00
3 |Bananas 401b/cs $25.75|401b $55.00(40 Ib $30.25(4011b $29.00
4 |Carrots, Baby, Whole 51b/bg $7.53|51b $16.00(5 Ib $27.50|5 Ib $8.95
5 |Celery, Sticks 51b/bg $10.70|51b $20.00(5 Ib $0.00|No Bid $12.50
6 |Cucumbers, Whole Pound $1.40(11b $2.00|By the pound $1.80(11b $1.50
7 |Grapes, Red, Seedless 22 1b/lug $36.60(221b $63.00(18 Ib/lug $77.00 $40.00(22 Ib $44.00
8 |Lettuce/Romaine, Chopped |5 1b/bg $5.48(21b $13.70 $25.00(5 Ib $4.85|2 1b $12.13 $12.50
9 |Orange, Whole 88 ct/cs $36.42|88 ct $60.00(88 ct $46.00(88 ct $38.00
10 |Strawberries Flat $24.75|8x11b $59.00|Flat $38.00(81 pt $26.00
11 |Tomatoes, Whole 5x6- 2 layer/cs $27.75|5x6- 2 layer $50.00|5x6 2 layer cs $31.00(10 Ib $62.00 $28.00
12 |Tomatoes, Cherry Pint $4.00 | Pint $5.00|Pint $2.50|Pint $2.50
TOTAL $253.76 $261.98 $421.00 $435.00 $308.90 $347.18 $304.95
Price calculated to equal UM requested $411.29 S$424.00 $652.50 $549.54 $518.95

No bid




