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(B)
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(D)

BOARD OF TRUSTEES

AGENDA

Workshop

Regular

Special

Report Only

Presenter(s):

Recognition

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 161406 FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT

OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR
SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding

this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHoOOL DiIsSTRICT

PHasted, fro Tecellence
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
j Digitally signed by Luis A. Vélez
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Date: 2015.07.08 14:55:55
-05'00'
Date: Monday, June 29, 2015
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 161406 for Janitorial
Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 161406 for Janitorial Supplies be awarded in accordance
with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached
Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EacLE Pass, Texas 78852 @  TeL (830) 773-5181 ®  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

AN EquaL OrrorTuniTY EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 161406 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Matera Paper

Mayfield Paper

Pyramid School

Safeway Supply

I:‘e: Dekrngen E;::::a::: Eagle Grocery | Gulf Coast Paper Company e gLl e Vicco Supply
Eagle Pass, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Angelo, TX Tampa, FL San Antonio, TX Eagle Pass, TX
1 | JOOS|ANT KILLER 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 14.32
2 | JO21|BELT, SAFETY 5 NO BID $ 40.24| S 7.95 NO BID S 819 S 10.70 | $ 17.99
3 | J022|BELT, SAFETY - 40 NO BID $ 26.84| § 795 NOBD |[§ 819 $ 1070 $ 17.99
4 | J023|BELT, SAFETY 40 NO BID | $ 26.84| S 7.95 NO BID S 8.19| S 10.70| $ 17.99
S | JO24|BELT, SAFETY 50 NO BID 5 26.84| S 8.12 NO BID S 8.19|$ 10.70| $ 17.99
6 | JO25|BLEACH, GERMICIDAL 5,000 NO BID $ 159 S 1.84| S 1.73 NO BID $ 1.85| S 1.38
7 | J039|BROOM, PLASTIC (ANGLE) 70 NO BID | NO BID S 5.60 NO BID $ 9.19 NO BID $ 9.99
8 | J040|BROOM, STRAW 50 NO BID S 953§ 7.29 NO BID 4.97* 6.75* S 4.99
9 | J055|BRUSH, COMMODE 40 NO BID : NO BID S 219§ 178 $ 0895 129§ 1.89
10 | JO75/BRUSH, SCRUB 10 NO BID NO BID S 3.15 NO BID S 0.88 NO BID S 2.99
11 | JO86|CAN, GARBAGE (PLASTIC) 25 NO BID | § 29.68| 5 23.30 NO BID S 28.98 19.00* S 43.80
12 | J110|CLEANER, CARPET 20 NO BID NO BID 5 179 $ 4.62| 3 5.58 NO BID S 6.07
13 | J116|CLEANER, CHALKBOARD 500 NO BID NO BID S 2.19 NO BID S 181 S 247§ 3.95
14 | J120|CLEANER, DISINFECTANT 250 NO BID S 40.62| $ 23.30 NO BID NO BID S 21.70| § 17.75
15 | J121|CLEANER, DISINFENCTANT 200 NO BID S 3119/ § 23.75 NO BID NO BID S 21.70| 19.00
16 | J123|CLEANER, DRAIN 15 NO BID S 191 3 2.21 NO BID S 6.29 NO BID S 2.99
17 | J125|CLEANER, GENERAL PURPOSE 750 NO BID S 6.35| S 6.88| S 5.14 NO BID NO BID S 4.45
18 | J130|CLEANER, GLASS 200 NO BID S 4923 475 $ 5.15 NO BID NO BID S 2.99
19 | J140|CLEANER, BOWL 100 NO BID S 8.59| 5 9.38| § 7.81 NO BID NO BID $ 16.39
20 | J145[CLEANER, FLOOR 550 NO BID S 533 S 5.80| $ '5.95|  NOBID NOBD  |S§ 5.75
21 | J150|CLEANER, PORCELAIN AND ENAMEL 80 NO BID S 2.23| S 228§ 2.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 | J160|CLEANER, STAINLESS STEEL 400 NO BID S 333 S 3.63 NO BID s 212| S 2.24| % 2.99
23 | J165|CLEANER, OVEN & GRILL 500 NO BID $ 2878 590 $ 5.40| $ 219 S 246 S 3.75
24 | J170|CLEANSER, POWDER 350 NO BID NO BID S 0.98 NO BID 0.98* NO BID NO BID
25 | J195|DEODORANT, BLOCK 100 NO BID S 12.81 § 11.15|  NOBID 5 6.24| S 671 S 8.90
26 | J197|DEODORANT, CARPET 100 NO BID NO BID S 3.73 NO BID $ 3.74 NO BID 5 3.75
27 | J200|DEODORANT, GRANULES 200 NO BID S 2.00| $ 2.69 NO BID S 214| 5 2.62| 8 2.90
28 | J201|DEODORANT, URINAL SCREEN 30 NO BID $ 9.29| § 8.95 NO BID s 6.72| $ 6.80| $ 8.99
29 | J204|DEODORIZER, SPRAY 1,500 NO BID S 3.22($ 3.46 NO BID s 2.39| 5 336 S 3.95
30 | J210|DETERGENT, LAUNDRY 10 NO BID NO BID S 25.00| $ 26.56 | $ 54.98 NO BID S 59.99
31 | J220|DISINFECTANT, SPRAY 600 NO BID S 2695 2.75 NO BID $ 229§ 225| S 4.25
32 | J222|DISINFECTANT, FOAMY CLEANER 1,300 NO BID S 223§ 2.29 NO BID S 2.19| 8 2.00] $ 3.29
33 | J224|DISINFECTANT, TOTAL RELEASE 300 NO BID NO BID S 2.70 NO BID NO BID 5 442 % 4.99
34 | J255|DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 130 NO BID NO BID S 2.15 NO BID S 7.98| $ 9.33|$ 11.37
35 | J260|DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 40 NO BID NO BID $ 3.20 NO BID S 8.98| S 9425 12.69
36 | J279|HEAD, DUSTMOP 300 NO BID NOBID S 8.28 NO BID S 7.97 5.30* S 12.73
37 | J285|HEAD, DUSTMOP 250 NO BID NO BID S 12.12 NO BID $ 14.91 7.42* 5 17.47
38 | J290(HEAD, DUSTMOP 100 NO BID NO BID S 14.95 NO BID $ 19.59 11.20* S 24.65
39 | J295|HEAD, DUSTMOP 70 NO BID NO BID s 24.95| $ 2496| $ 28.75| S 20.80| § 39.99
40 | J310|HOSE, RUBBER (GARDEN) 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 79.99

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 161406 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Matera Paper | Mayfield Paper | Pyramid School | Safeway Supply
Ilt“e: Description 25:]:::;1 Eagle Grocery | Gulf Coast Paper o i = P e Vicco Supply

Eagle Pass, TX San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX San Angelo, TX Tampa, FL San Antonlo, TX Eagle Pass, TX
41 | J336|LAMP, FLUORESCENT (F32T8/SP41/ECO) 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 64.80
42 | J385|LAMP, INCADESCENT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 4.48
43 | J390|LAMP, INCADESCENT 1 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID ~ NOBID s 6.48 |
44 | J395|LAMP, INCADESCENT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 6.98
45 | J415|LUBRICANT, MULTIPURPOSE 50 NO BID NO BID 5 6.23 NO BID S 4.55 5.10* S 5.46
46 | J420|LINER, CAN 2,500 NO BID S 13.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.50* S 14.25
47 | J421|LINER, CAN 800 21.00* S 23.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.65* S 26.95
48 | J424|LINER, CAN 700 NO BID S 28.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.60* S 32.50
49 | J425|MAT, FLOOR 1 NO BID NO BID S 25.00 NO BID S 12.98 NO BID S 14.00
50 | J430|MAT, FLOOR 10 NO BID NO BID S 140.00 NO BID S 25.75 NO BID S 25.80
51 | J435/MOP, BOWL 1 NO BID S 0.55| S 0.53 NO BID S 0.55( S 0.65 NO BID
52 | J440|MOP, HANDLE (WET) 70 NO BID NO BID S 17.15 NO BID S 14.89 9.62* S 17.85
53 | J441|MOP, HANDLE (WOOQD) 80 NO BID | § 7.30| S 5.84|S 536| S 5.79| S 515| S 5.85
54 | 1J445|MOP, HEAD (24 o0z.) 550 NO BID S 3.49/| $ 5.38 NO BID S 4.92 3.53* S 5.99
55 | J446|MOP, HEAD (16 o0z.) 600 NO BID S 2.28| S 3.76 NO BID 5 3.39 2.52* S 4.49
56 | JA6O|PADS, CLEANING 20 NO BID S 9.09| S 063 $ 040 $ 0.21 NO BID S 0.35
57 | J470|PAD, POLISHING 20 NO BID $ 12.38| S 2.62 NO BID S 1.80 NO BID S 3.49
58 J472|PAD, POLISHING 100 NO BID 5 5.04| S 5.26 NO BID 2.19* NO BID S 7.00
59 | J482|PAD, STRIPPING 250 NO BID S 5.18| S 5.40 NO BID 2.19* NO BID S 7.00
60 | J485|PAN,DUST 70 NO BID s 10.79| $ 1100 $ 9.25[ 8 6.99 2000 |3 8.25
61 | J495|PLUNGER, TOILET BOWL 1 NO BID S B 5.04| S 3.87 NO BID S 3.98| $ 2.85| S 2.49
62 J500|POLISH, FURNITURE 200 NO BID S 245 S 2.48 NO BID S 2.18| S 225| S 2.99
63 | J505/RAGS, CLEANING 200 NO BID | S 12.28| $ 12.29 NO BID S 14.99 NO BID S 12.99
64 | 1510/ RAKE, GARDEN 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 13.98
65 | J515|RAKE, LAWN 1 NO BID NO BID NOBID ~ NOBID NO BID ~ NOBD  |[$ 13.98|
66 | J520|REMOVER, GUM 1 NO BID NO BID S 2.81 NO BID S 191 S 1.96| $ 3.75
67 | J522|REMOVER, MILDEW STAIN 30 NO BID | NO BID S 4.20| S 2.36 NO BID NO BID S 4.25
68 | 1557|SIGN, CAUTION (WET FLOOR) 1 NO BID 5 9.06| S 8.99 NO BID S 529 S 5.00| $ 5.49
69 | JS59|SANITIZER, REFILL 40 NO BID NO BID 5 59.99 NO BID S 65.99 NO BID S 68.00
70 | JS60|SANITIZER, HAND ANTISEPTIC 550 NO BID NO BID S 3.75 NO BID 3.49* NO BID S 3.99
71 | J562|SOAP, HAND 1,000 NO BID NO BID S 8.75 NO BID 7.85* NO BID S 7.99
72 | J565|SOAP, HAND 200 NO BID NO BID S 1.16 NO BID $ 0.89 NO BID $ 0.98
73 | J574|SPONGE, SCRUBBING 1 NO BID ‘ S 31.19| $ 32.99 NO BID 12.98* NO BID S 46.60
74 | J575|SPONGES 80 NO BID | NO BID $ 0.54 NO BID S 0.52 NO BID S 0.99
75 | J580|SPRAYGUN, PLASTIC 500 NO BID | 8 0.85| S 0.99 NO BID S 0.83 NO BID S 1.49
76 | J615|STRIPPER, WAX 150 NO BID | § 41.56| S 41.65| S 40.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 | J625|TISSUE, TOILET 2,000 NO BID | S 3430 $ 34.70| $ 32.36 NO BID 29.10* 5 32.80
78 | J630(|TISSUE, TOILET FIXTURE 30 NO BID NO BID S 11.35 NO BID S 5.89 NO BID S 5.42
79 | J633|TOWELS, PAPER (MULTI-FOLD) 350 NQ BID S 15.85| S 15.30| § 14.98 NO BID S 14.90| S 16.13
80 | J635|TOWELS, PAPER (ROLL) 1,300 NO BID S 17.55| § 16.64 | $ 16.35 NO BID S 15.60| S 18.11

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 161406 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
item 4 Estimated | Eagle Grocery | Gulf Coast Paper Matera Paper | Mayfield Paper | Pyramid School | Safeway Supply Vicco5upply
e escription Quantity Company Co. Products Inc.
¥ Eagle Pass, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Angelo, TX Tampa, FL San Antonlo, TX Eagle Pass, TX

81 | JBAO|TREATMENT, DUSTMOP 200 NO BID NO BID $ 15.00( $ 14.95 NO BID NO BID ¢ 16.25
82 | J655|WAX, FLOOR 500 NO BID |'§ 49,98/ $ 51.84| $ 51.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 |M430|GLOVES, LATEX 150 NO BID NOBID | S 475 S 575| % ~ 519|8§ 395/ $ 4.25
84 |Ma32|GLOVES, LATEX 450 'NO BID NO BID 5 4.75| $ 5338 519|$ 395| S 4.25
85 |M434|GLOVES, LATEX 350 NO BID NO BID S 450 $ 533] § 5.19| % 3.95| $ 4.25
86 |M436|GLOVES, VINYL 50 NO BID NO BID $ 2758 349 $ 3.49| % 2.05| % 2.75
87 |M438|GLOVES, VINYL 200 NO BID NO BID $ 275] $ 349 $ 3.49| § 2.05| $ 2.75
88 |M440|GLOVES, VINYL 550 NO BID NO BID $ 2758 349/ ¢ 349 S 205 $ 2.75
89 | T995/WASTEBASKET 1 NO BID : NO BID $ 4.65 NO BID $ 3.49 NO BID s 6.99
90 | T996|WASTEBASKET 50 NO BID S 464/ % 4,99 NO BID $ 331 NO BID S 6.99
91 | T997|WASTEBASKET 50 NO BID \ NO BID $ 6.88 NO BID $ 5.82 NO BID $ 1253

Proposal Notes:

Prices are per unit cost
* Not bid as specified

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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