
Project: 2019 PAVING WORK

Owner: PROSPECT HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 23

Project No.: 18102

Bid Date/Time: on January 31, 2019 at 10:30 AM 

CONTRACTOR
UNIT PRICE NO. 1 (UNSUITABLE 

SOILS REMOVAL / C.Y.)

UNIT PRICE NO. 2 (HAULING OF 

NON-HAZARDOUS SPECIAL 

WASTE / LOAD)

UNIT PRICE NO. 3 (STONE FILL CA-

6 / C.Y.)

UNIT PRICE NO. 4 (STONE FILL CA-

7 / C.Y.)

UNIT PRICE NO. 5 (ASPHALT 

PAVEMENT / SF)

UNIT PRICE NO. 6 (8" CONCRETE 

PAVEMENT / SF)

UNIT PRICE NO. 7 (5" CONCRETE 

SIDEWALK/ SF)

UNIT PRICE NO. 8 (12" RCP PIPE / 

LF)

1 Allstar Asphalt
$40.00 $1,500.00 $70.00 $80.00 $10.00 $15.00 $12.00 $70.00

2 A Lamp Concrete
$50.00 $100.00 $40.00 $45.00 $31.00 $10.00 $8.00 $110.00

3 Schroeder Asphalt
$60.00 $1,650.00 $40.00 $42.00 $2.95 $17.00 $14.00 $60.00

4 Briggs Paving
$40.00 $126.50 $50.00 $58.00 $2.50 $18.00 $10.00 $80.00

5 Murphy Paving
$85.00 $375.00 $44.00 $45.00 $5.00 $12.50 $10.40 $135.00

6 Abbey Paving
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 Accu-Paving
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 Arrow Road Construction
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9 Maneval Construction
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 Maul Asphalt
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 Orange Crush, LLC
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

12

13
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