RFP #1805-12 Charter Transportation Services Bid Tabulation

Denton ISD

May 22, 2018

Red Carpet

Cowtown Bus

Simon's Executive
Car Service, Inc.

(CSl) Corporate
Services International

Lone Star Coaches,
Inc.

Echo Transportation

Description

UoMm

QTY

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

Extended

24 Passenger Bus Cost per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

Mile

No Bid

$2.45

$3.25

$2.80

$3.40

$3.50

24 Passenger Bus Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

Mile

No Bid

$1.45

$2.60

$2.40

$2.45

$2.75

35 Passenger Bus Price Per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

$3.15

$3.50

$3.00

$3.40

No Bid

35 Passenger Bus Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

$2.15

$2.75

$2.70

$2.45

No Bid

37 Passenger Bus Price Per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$3.50

No Bid

$3.40

$3.65

37 Passenger Bus Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

$2.75

No Bid

$2.45

$2.75

40 Passenger Bus Price Per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.40

$3.75

40 Passenger Bus Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.45

$2.75

47 Passenger Bus Price Per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.90

$3.60

No Bid

47 Passenger Bus Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.60

$2.45

No Bid

56 Passenger Bus Price Per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

$4.25

$3.85

$3.75

$3.90

$3.60

$4.00

56 Passenger Bus Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

$2.10

$2.65

$3.00

$3.60

$2.45

$2.75

58 Passenger Bus Price Per Mile Each Charter
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

58 Passenger Bust Cost Per Mile for Dead Head
Miles
Indicate Minimum Miles under Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

12 Passenger Bus/Van (Vehicle Rental Only,
Unlimited Mileage)

Indicate Cost per Mile, if not included, under Supplier
Notes

Indicate if this rental includes Storage Space, under
Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

15 Passenger Bus/Van (Vehicle Rental Only,
Unlimited Mileage)

Indicate Cost per Mile, if not included, under Supplier
Notes

Indicate if this rental includes Storage Space, under
Supplier Notes

EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Denton ISD

RFP #1805-12 Charter Transportation Services Bid Tabulation

May 22, 2018

Simon's Executive

(CSl) Corporate

Lone Star Coaches,

Red Carpet Cowtown Bus Car Service, Inc. Services International Inc. Echo Transportation
Description UOoM QTY Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
25 Passenger Bus/Van (Vehicle Rental Only,
Unlimited Mileage)
I'\rl\:tl;::te Cost per Mile, if not included, under Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Indicate if this rental includes Storage Space, under
Supplier Notes EA 1
35 Passenger Bus/Van (Vehicle Rental Only,
Unlimited Mileage)
I'\rl\:tlg:te Cost per Mile, if not included, under Supplier No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Indicate if this rental includes Storage Space, under
Supplier Notes EA 1
Price Per Mile Each Charter for Additional Passenger
Size. . . .
State Passenger Size and Minimum Miles Per Charter, $4.25 $2.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75
under Supplier Notes EA 1
Cost Per Mile for Dead Head Miles for Additional
Passenger Size. State Passenger Size and Minimum $2.10 $1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.75
Dead Head Miles under Supplier Notes. EA 1
Overnight Trip Charge.
Indicate Minimum Hours for 1 Overnight under $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $200.00 $1,125.00 $1,250.00
Supplier Notes EA 1
Charge for Additional Service. . .
State Service Provided under Supplier Notes EA 1 No Bid $0.00 $15.00 No Bid $100.00 $40.00
Charge for Additional Driver.
Indicate Number of miles when Additional Driver is No Bid $0.00 $500.00 $350.00 $175.00 $250.00
Required under Supplier Notes EA 1
List additional discounts for booking multiple trips.
(Example: pre books trips for multiple campus trips No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00 $0.00
that will take place over a 2-3 month period) EA 1
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