ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid #12-033 Addendum 1

Classroom Technology Equipment Bid

11/15/2012 8:00:00 AM Central

12/12/2012 2:00:00 PM Central

Line Items
Projector - XGA
resolution and 2800

EPSON Powerlite X12 lumens of color/white

Line 1 Multimedia Projector light output.

Name Unit Price  MfgNo Alternate Specification

CDWG* $387.99

B&H Photo Vido $399.00

Southern Computer Warehouse Inc $400.98

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. $406.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc $411.50

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS $413.00

Summit Integration Systems $425.00

Schoolhouse Audio Visual $430.00

VSA, Inc. $438.65

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. $440.00

Data Projections $444.00
Projector Ceiling
MountQd

Line 2 EPSON ELPMBPJF

Name Unit Price  MfgNo Alternate Specification

CDWG* $68.25

Summit Integration Systems $70.00

Southern Computer Warehouse Inc $70.34

B&H Photo Vido $72.00

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. $75.00

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS $78.00

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. $80.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc $80.90

Schoolhouse Audio Visual

$84.00



VSA, Inc. $86.16
Data Projections $87.00
Document Cameral]
O
Must be compatible with
SMART Technologies
Line 3 AverVision F30 white boards.
Name Unit Price  MfaNo Alternate Specification
CDWG* $374.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. $447.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc $452.39
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc $463.99
HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS $473.00
VSA, Inc. $491.15
Summit Integration Systems $511.00
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. $511.06
B&H Photo Vido $525.00
Data Projections $545.00
Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid
REPLACEMENT LAMP
Line 4 InFocus SP-LAMP-057  for InFocus IN2112
Name Unit Price  MfaNo Alternate Specification
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc* $153.75
CDWG $153.90
Pyramid School Products $159.95
B&H Photo Vido $160.00
Checkpoint Services, Inc $161.81
Summit Integration Systems $164.00
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. $165.00
HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS $168.00
VSA, Inc. $170.66
Schoolhouse Audio Visual $175.00
Data Projections $199.00
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. No Bid



Front Row Pro Digital

Teacher Amplifier

Line 5 PD-IR System

Name Unit Price  MfaNo Alternate Specification

Checkpoint Services, Inc* $1,097.59

Data Projections $1,125.00

Summit Integration Systems $1,130.00

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS $1,275.00

B&H Photo Vido No Bid

VSA, Inc. No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid

CDWG No Bid

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. No Bid

Southern Computer Warehouse Inc No Bid
SMARTboard 660-64"[1
Interactive whiteboard

Line 6 SMARTBOARD SB660 only

Name Unit Price  MfgNo Alternate Specification

Summit Integration Systems* $1,123.00

Data Projections $1,300.00

VSA, Inc. No Bid

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS No Bid

B&H Photo Vido No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid

CDWG No Bid

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. No Bid

Southern Computer Warehouse Inc No Bid
SMARTboard 680-77"0
Interactive whiteboard

Line 7 SMARTBOARD SB680 only

Name Unit Price  MfgNo Alternate Specification

Summit Integration Systems* $1,362.00



Data Projections

VSA, Inc.

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS
B&H Photo Vido

Checkpoint Services, Inc

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC.

Schoolhouse Audio Visual

CDWG

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc.
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc

$1,552.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

SMARTboard 685-87"0
Interactive whiteboard

Line 8 SMARTBOARD SB685 only

Name Unit Price  MfaNo Alternate Specification

Summit Integration Systems* $1,721.00

Data Projections $1,947.56

VSA, Inc. No Bid

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS No Bid

B&H Photo Vido No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc No Bid

AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid

CDWG No Bid

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. No Bid

Southern Computer Warehouse Inc No Bid
SMARTboard 690-94"[]
Interactive whiteboard

Line 9 SMARTBOARD only

Name Unit Price  MfaNo Alternate Specification

Summit Integration Systems* $1,789.00

Data Projections $2,020.73

VSA, Inc. No Bid

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS No Bid

B&H Photo Vido No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc No Bid



AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC.

No Bid

Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid
CDWG No Bid
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. No Bid
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc No Bid
Mobile Floor Stand for
Line 10 SMART FS-SB660 SB660
Name Unit Price  MfaNo Alternate Specification
Summit Integration Systems* $297.00
Data Projections $369.00
VSA, Inc. No Bid
HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS No Bid
B&H Photo Vido No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid
CDWG No Bid
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. No Bid
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc No Bid
SMARTboard X880-77"
Line 11 SMART SBX880i5 with UF75 Projector
Name Unit Price  MfgNo Alternate Specification
Summit Integration Systems* $3,635.00
Data Projections $3,995.00
VSA, Inc. No Bid
HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS No Bid
B&H Photo Vido No Bid
Checkpoint Services, Inc No Bid
AVES AUDIO VISUAL SYSTEMS, INC. No Bid
Schoolhouse Audio Visual No Bid
CDWG No Bid
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. No Bid
Southern Computer Warehouse Inc No Bid

*Awarded Vendor



