
Date: Friday, February 28, 2025

Company 
White Paper Bid 

Price Per Case
Color Paper Bid 
Price Per Case

Birght Paper Bid 
Price Per Case

8.5" x 14" Paper 
Bid Price Per Case

11" x 17" Paper Bid 
Price Per Case Total

Contract Paper Group, Inc International International International International International International
1013 Portage Trail, Unit 2 20#: $91.10
Cuyahoga Falls, OH 44221 24#: $122.22
800-563-5739 ext. 4224 60#: $122.22

65#: $58.00
Jennifer Oshel USA / Natual Choice USA / Natual Choice USA / Natual Choice USA / Natual Choice USA / Natual Choice USA/Natural Choice
joshel@cpgbid.com 20#: $91.10

24#: $122.22
60#: $122.22
65#: $58.00

Veritiv Operating Company International International International International International International
4901 Belfort Rd 20#:$ 54.25
Jacksonville, FL 32256 24#: $54.25

60#: $54.25
Joseph Souhrada 65#: $49.40
joe.souharda@veritivcorp.com USA USA USA USA USA USA
Debbi Smith 20#: $54.25

24#: $54.25
60#: $54.25
65#: $49.40

Staples International International International International International International
500 Staples Drive 20#: NO BID
Farmingham, MA 01702 24#: NO BID
720-744-1287 60#: NO BID

65#: NO BID
Lina Galloro USA USA USA USA USA USA
Lina.Galloro@staples.com 20#: $39.75 /$79.50

24#: $92.00
60#: $92.00
65#: $52.50

Sealed Bids for 2025-2026 Copier Paper
Geneva CUSD 304

$31.86 

34.15 / $30.90

$33.45 

$33.85

NO BID

$37.80

$77,955.81 

$82,366.35 / 
$76, 106.85

$53.95 

$53.95

$59.00 

$59.00

$47.00 

$47.00

$78,809.21 

$79,579.61

$52.75 

$52.75

$51.80 

$51.80

$41.80 

$41.80

NO BID

$60.00

NO BID

$68.00

NO BID

$58.50

NO BID

$89,402.05
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Price Per Case
Color Paper Bid 
Price Per Case

Birght Paper Bid 
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11" x 17" Paper Bid 
Price Per Case Total

Midland Paper Company International International International International International International
101 E Palatine Rd. 20#: $54.25
Wheeling, IL 60090 24#: $119.50
847-777-2710 60#: $119.50

65#: $48.70
Doug Damascus USA USA USA USA USA USA
Doug.damascus@midlandpaper.com 20#: NO BID

24#: NO BID
60#: NO BID
65#: NO BID

Murnane Paper International International International International International International
345 Fischer Farm Rd 20#: $86.60
Elmhurst, IL 60126 24#: $86.60
630-215-3661 60#: $105.40

65#: $64.30
Terry Murnane USA USA USA USA USA USA
terrym@murnanepaper.com 20#: NO BID

24#: NO BID
60#: NO BID
65#: NO BID

School Specialty

Garvey's Office Products
7500 North Caldwell
Niles, IL 60714-4027
800-621-1503
Kevin Garvey
keving@getgarveys.com

NO BID 20#: 

60#: 

60#: 
NO BID 20#: 

$32.40 

NO BID

$51.00 

NO BID

$47.70 

NO BID

$37.50 

NO BID

$78,402.80 

NO BID

$31.45

NO BID

$58.50 - cream
$52.20 - all others

NO BID

$43.95

NO BID

$34.45

NO BID

$77,225.70

NO BID
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