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3.2​ APPROVAL OF ROUTINE PERSONNEL MATTERS 

 
A.​ EMPLOYMENT OF LICENSED PROFESSIONALS, EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT 

PERSONNEL AND STIPEND/COACH POSITIONS 
 
Approve the employment of Courtny Adedayo as Food Service Personnel for the 
2025-2026 school year at 2.5 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. (CLAY) 
 
Approve the employment of Diana Barlev as Noon Hour Associate for the 2025-2026 
school year at 2 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. (VDELC) 
 
Approve the employment of Jacob Brucker as Special Education One-to-One Associate for 
the 2025-2026 school year at 6.5 hours per day, 5 days per week $18.10 per hour. (DES)  
 
Approve the employment of Alexis Goodger as Bus Associate for the 2025-2026 school 
year at 3 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. (Transportation) 
 
Approve the employment of Natalie Hughey in an additional position as Bus Associate for 
the 2025-2026 school year at 1 hour per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. 
(Transportation) 
 
Approve the employment of Amanda Jurewicz as Special Education One-to-One Associate 
for the 2025-2026 school year at 6.5 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. 
(GWE) 
 
Approve the employment of Krysta Lira as Food Service Personnel for the 2025-2026 
school year at 4.5 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. (NWMS) 
 
Approve the employment of Sandra Ortiz as Special Education Classroom Associate for 
the 2025-2026 school year at 6.5 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. (DES) 
 
Approve the employment of Romina Vizcarra Alvarado in an additional position as Bus 
Associate for the 2025-2026 school year at 1.5 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per 
hour. (Transportation) 
 
Approve the employment of Heather White as Special Education Classroom Associate for 
the 2025-2026 school year at 6 hours per day, 5 days per week, $18.10 per hour. (GWE) 
 
Approve the employment of Nicholas Aiello as Computer/Tech. Advisor for the 2025-2026 
school year at a stipend of $2,312. (WHS) 
 
Approve the employment of Sarai Butler in an additional position as Yearbook Advisor for 
the 2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $2,312. (NWMS) 
 
Approve the employment of Kathleen Brayer in an additional position as Green Club 
Advisor for the 2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $2,312. (WNHS) 
 
Approve the employment of Ashley Buckingham in an additional position as 3rd Grade 
PLC Lead for the 2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $1,211. (WWE) 
 
Approve the employment of David Guza in an additional position as Winter Weight Room 
Supervisor for the 2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $2,312. (WNHS) 



 
 

A.​ EMPLOYMENT OF LICENSED PROFESSIONALS, EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT 
PERSONNEL AND STIPEND/COACH POSITIONS (cont’d) 

 
Approve the employment of Stacy Heiliger as Flag Corp Advisor for the 2025-2026 school 
year at a stipend of $2,312. (WNHS) 
 
Approve the employment of Cassidy Ryan as Assistant Fall Cheer Coach for the 
2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $2,312. (WNHS) 
 
Approve the employment of Cassidy Ryan as Assistant Winter Cheer Coach for the 
2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $2,312. (WNHS) 
 
Approve the employment of Thomas Wollpert in an additional position as Elementary 
STEM Curriculum Area Specialist for the 2025-2026 school year at a stipend of $4,450. 
(District) 
 

​ ​ And any other employment prior to the meeting. 
​ ​  

B.​ TRANSFERS/CHANGES/RECLASSIFICATIONS/CORRECTION OF RECORDS 
OF LICENSED PROFESSIONALS, EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT PERSONNEL 
AND STIPEND/COACH POSITIONS 
 
Approve a change in hours for Erica Batdorff for the 2025-2026 school year to 2.5 hours 
per day, 5 days per week. (GWE – Noon Hour Associate) 
 
Approve the reclassification of position for Eddie Cornett to Substitute Bus Driver for the 
2025-2026 school year. (Transportation) 
 
Approve a change in hours for Samantha Hess for the 2025-2026 school year to 6 hours 
per day, 5 days per week. (Transportation – Bus Associate) 
 
Approve a change in hours for Mandie Johnson for the 2025-2026 school year to 2.5 hours 
per day, 5 days per week. (GWE – Noon Hour Associate) 
 
Approve the reclassification of position for Rebecca Potoczky to Substitute Bus Driver for 
the 2025-2026 school year. (Transportation) 
 
Approve the transfer of Christina Schaffter to a position of Lead Job Coach for the 
2025-2026 school year at 7 hours per day, 5 days per week, $19.75 per hour. (WNHS) 
 
Approve a change in hours for Rose Stygar for the 2025-2026 school year to 2.5 hours per 
day, 5 days per week. (GWE – Noon Hour Associate) 
 
Approve a change in hours for Viral Virani for the 2025-2026 school year to 8 hours per 
day, 5 days per week. (District – Technology Support Personnel) 
 
Approve a change in hours for Scott Wizniak for the 2025-2026 school year to 7.25 hours 
per day, 5 days per week. (Transportation) 
 
And any other transfers/changes/reclassifications/correction of records prior to the 
meeting. 
 



 
 

                     
C.​  RESIGNATION/RETIREMENT OF LICENSED PROFESSIONALS, EDUCATION- 

AL SUPPORT PERSONNEL AND STIPEND/COACH POSITIONS 
 
Approve the resignation of Nicole Cannegieter, effective September 17, 2025. (VDELC – 
Special Education Classroom Associate) 
 
Approve the resignation of Nancy Diaz Escorza, effective September 26, 2025. (OES – 
Special Education One-to-One Associate) 
 
Approve the resignation of Jennifer Lajka, effective September 25, 2025. (CLAY – Special 
Education Classroom Health Associate) 
 
Approve the retirement of Mary Beth Martin-Bellavia, effective the end of the 2026-2027 
school year. (PWE – LRC Associate) 
 
Approve the resignation of Adileni Sanchez Mercado, effective September 18, 2025. (WWE 
– Special Education Classroom Associate) 
 
Approve the resignation of Christina Stelly, effective September 9, 2025. (Transportation – 
Bus Associate) 
 
Approve the resignation of Kathleen Lacey-Anderson from the position of 5th Grade PLC 
Lead only, effective the end of the 2024-2025 school year. (WWE) 
 
Approve the resignation of Megan McDaniel from the stipend position of Drama Advisor 
only, effective the end of the 2024-2025 school year. (NWMS) 
 
Approve the resignation of Conor Reyes from the position of Assistant Wrestling Coach 
only, effective the end of the 2024-2025 school year. (NWMS) 
 
And any other resignations/retirements prior to the meeting. 

 
D.​ LEAVES OF ABSENCE 

 
Approve a leave of absence for Alexandra Heberly beginning September 2, 2025, and 
continuing through an anticipated return date of October 2, 2025. (CLAY – Special 
Education Teacher) 
 
Approve a leave of absence for Milandy Horan with an anticipated start date of December 
7, 2025, and continuing for 30 workdays thereafter. (WNHS – Spanish Teacher) 
 
Approve a leave of absence for Zachary Cullum beginning March 30, 2026, and continuing 
through a return date of April 20, 2026. (GWE – RTI Associate) 
 
Approve an intermittent leave of absence for Christina Watson beginning September 16, 
2025 and continuing through the end of the 2025-2026 school year. (MEES – Special 
Education Classroom Associate) 
 
And any other leaves of absence prior to the meeting. 
 


