AGENDA ITEM 23
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

(B)

©

(D)

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X

Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 162207 FOR CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES AND THE BOARD
DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED
BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.
BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHoOL DisTRICT

Hasbed frv Cecellence
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis A.
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Vélez
Date: 2015.06.29 13:06:45
Date: Monday, June 29, 2015 0500
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 162207 for Charter

Bus Transportation Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 162207 for Charter Bus Transportation Services be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and
as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EacLe Pass, Texas 78852 @  Tew (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

AN Equat OprrortuniTy EMPLOYER
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

D‘:'.ll;li :F (Brll"s DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel Co:?:;:“s Kerrville OK Tours anﬁelf;:e RiverCity
San Antonlo, TX _ Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX |
8/6/15 1 Del Rio, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | $ 2416 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,395 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
8/7/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,100 | $ 2951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
8/11/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High | § 1,200 $ 2,951 | § 1490 | $ 1950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
8/12/15 1 Uvalde, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,100 | $ 2,458 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,595 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
08/13-15/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2,400 | $ 5350 | $ 1,490 | $ 5020 | $ 3,035 | $ 4,021 | § 2,400
08/13-15/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 2,250 | $ 5350 | $ 1,525 | $ 5020 | § 3,035 | § 3,771 | & 2,400
08/13-15/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2250 | $ 5350 | $ 1,525 | $ 5020 | $ 3,035 | $ 3,771 | § 2,400
8/14/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 | $ 2951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
8/14/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,400 | $ 2951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
8/14/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 | $ 2951 | % 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
8/14/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 | $ 2,951 | § 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
8/14/15 2 Pearsall, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,500 | $ 2317 | $ 1,450 | % 1,950 | $ 1,850 | $ 1,870 | $ 1,150
8/14/15 2 Pearsall, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 | $ 2317 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,850 | $ 1,870 | $ 1,150
8/14/15 2 Pearsall, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 | $ 2317 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,850 | $ 1,870 | § 1,150
8/18/15 1 Carrizo Springs, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | $ 2335 | % 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | § 1,49 | $ 1,080
8/18/15 1 Schertz, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | $ 3,267 | $ 1,550 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | § 2,463 | $ 1,300
08/20-22/15 1 Floresville, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2,400 | $ 5,350 | $ 1,550 | $ 5020 | $ 3,305 | % 2,463 | $ 1,300
08/20-22/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 2,250 | $ 5350 | $ 1,525 | $ 5020 | $ 3,305 | $ 3771 | % 2,400
8/21/15 2 Del Rio, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 | $ 2,595 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
8/21/15 2 Del Rio, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 | $ 2,595 | $ 1,350 | § 1950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
8/21/15 2 Del Rio, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 | $ 2,595 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
8/22/15 1 Carrizo Springs, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,195 | $ 1,933 | $ 1,350 | § 1,950 | § 01,200 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
8/22/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,195 | $ 1933 | % 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,200 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
8/22/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,195 | $ 3,666 | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
8/22/15 1 Knippa, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 | $ 2,535 | $ 1,400 | $ 2,200 | $ 3,300 | $ 1,590 | & 1,150
8/22/15 1 Uvalde, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,200 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,525 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
8/25/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | % 1,250
8/25/15 1 Uvalde, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,525 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
8/27/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
8/27/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
08/27-29/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 2,600 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 5020 | $ 3,305 | $ 4,021 | $ 1,250
08/27-29/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2,600 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 5020 | $ 3,305 | $ 4,021 | $ 1,250
8/28/15 2 San Antonio, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,525 | ¢ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
8/29/15 1 Mission, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,850 | $ 3,100 | $ 3,300 | $ 3,600 | $ 1,910
8/29/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 No Bid
8/29/15 2 San Antonio, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,895 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
8/29/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,350 | % 1,950 | ¢ 1,525 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
8/29/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,525 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
8/29/15 1 San Antonio, TX Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/1/15 1 Crystal City, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 1 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

D?:::F ;"_:_3 DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel lel.lg:;ssus Kerrville OK Tours c;;‘e:ge:;:e RiverCity
San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonlo, TX San ™ San Antonlo, TX | San Antonlo, TX
9/2/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | 1,250
9/2/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 1,250
9/3/15 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,496 | § 1,080
9/3/15 2 Carrizo Springs, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
9/3/15 1 Del Rio, TX 7th & Bth Grade Volleyball - M. J.H. | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | § 1,496 | $ 1,150
9/5/15 1 Crystal City, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,080
9/5/15 1 Crystal City, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,080
9/5/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | ¢ 1,950 | $ 1,595 | § 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/5/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7th & Bth Grade Volleyball -M. J.H. | $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,595 | § 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/7/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,595 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/8/15 1 Poteet, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 NoBid | $ 1,550 | ¢ 2,350 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/11/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,350 NoBid | $ 1,490 | ¢ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
9/14/15 1 Laredo, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | ¢ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/14/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball -M.J. H. | $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,550 | § 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/15/15 1 Laredo, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
9/17/15 2 Carrizo Springs, TX 7th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
9/17/15 2 Carrizo Springs, TX 8th Grade Football - M. 1. H. $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,49 | § 1,080
9/17/15 1 Del Rio, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
9/17/15 2 Del Rio, TX 8th Grade Football - E. P. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
9/17/15 2 San Antonio, TX Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/17/15 2 San Antonio, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
9/19/15 | 1 |  DelRio, TX ~ 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. J. H. | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,4% | § 1,150
9/19/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/19/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/19/15 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | § 1,250
9/22/15 2 Del Rio, TX 7th Grade Football - M. 1. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
9/22/15 1 Del Rio, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
9/22/15 1 Jourdanton, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,550 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 2,151 | § 1,250
9/22/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/24/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | § 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/24/15 2 San Antonio, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/25/15 5 | San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High No Bid NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | § 1,925 | $ 2,369 No Bid
9/25/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 No Bid
9/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/25/15 2 San Antonio, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/25/15 2 San Antonio, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | % 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
9/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 2 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

DATE OF 3111_3 e S Sroln City Tours | Clark Travel | “*/927 Y% | wermvile | oKk Tours | Re9eNt | piyerciry
San Antonlo, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Anttonio, TX
9/26/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
9/29/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/1/15 | 2 | San Antonio, TX 1. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid [ $§ 1,525 $ 1,950 | 1,95 % 2369 | % 1,250
10/3/15 1 Round Rock, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,725 | $ 2,300 | $ 3,100 | $ 1,700
10/3/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/3/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/3/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/3/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/6/15 1 Laredo, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/6/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | 2,182 | § 1,250
10/6/15 2 Uvalde, TX 7th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | § 1,150
10/8/15 2 Del Rio, TX 7th Grade Football - E. P. J. H. $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
10/8/15 1 Laredo, TX 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. 1. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/8/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | % 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/8/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1490 | % 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | & 1,250
10/8/15 2 Uvalde, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/8/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/9/15 5 Uvalde, TX Band - C.C. Winn High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 No Bid
10/9/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | § 1,150
10/9/15 2 Uvalde, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/9/15 1 Uvalde, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | § 1,150
| 10/10/15 | 5 San Antonio, TX ~ Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 _ NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2100 | $ 2369  NoBid
10/10/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/13/15 2 Del Rio, TX 8th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
10/13/15 1 Somerset, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,500 | $ 1950 | $ 1,895 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/14/15 1 Laredo, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. . H.| $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1925 | % 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/15/15 1 Comstock, TX 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | % 1,777 | & 1,250
10/15/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/15/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/15/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/15/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/16-17/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 2,200 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 3,700 | $ 2,695 | % 2,182 | $ 2,400
10/17/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/17/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/17/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/20/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/21/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/22/15 5 Laredo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/22/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/22/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page3of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

DATE OF |BUS DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel COI:IQ::"SBIIS Kerrville OK Tours c:;zgeﬂ:e RiverCity

TRIP QTY San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
10/22/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
10/22/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
- 10/22-24/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 3,500 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 5020 § 3,695 % 2,182 | § 1,250
10/23/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,700 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/24/15 5 Corpus Christi, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,800 | ¢ 2,200 | $ 2,100 | $ 3,000 No Bid
10/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | § 3,000 | $ 1,700
10/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
10/27/15 1 Castroville, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 1,964 | $ 1,250
10/27/15 1 Del Rio, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | § 1,150
10/27/15 2 Somerset, TX 7th Grade Football - E. P. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,895 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
10/29/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | % 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/29/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/29/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,490 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/29/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
10/30/15 5 Laredo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/30/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | § 1,950 | § 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/30/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/30-31/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 2,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,695 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
10/31/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
11/3/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | § 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
11/4/15 2 Somerset, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,895 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
11/5/15 | 2 Del Rio, TX Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
11/5/15 2 Del Rig, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
11/7/15 1 Round Rock, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,650 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,725 | $ 2,350 | ¢ 3,100 | $ 1,700
11/7/15 1 Round Rack, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,650 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,725 | $ 2,350 | $ 3,100 | $ 1,700
11/12-14/15 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 3,000 No Bid | $ 1,525 | % 5,020 | $ 3,600 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
11/13/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | 3 2,182 No Bid
11/13/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
11/20/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
11/20/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
12/04-05/15 | 2 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 2,250 No Bid | $ 1525 | $ 3,680 | $ 1,925 | % 2,369 | $ 2,160
- 12/11-12/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 4,000 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 7,690 | $ 2,695 | § 2,369 | $ 2,160
12/12/15 3 Castroville, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | & 1,964 | $ 1,250
12/19/15 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | ¢ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
01/21-22/16 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 2,160
01/22-23/16 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 2,160
1/30/16 1 Cibolo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,600 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,250 | $ 2,463 | $ 1,350
1/30/16 2 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
02/05-06/16 | 1 San Marcos, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,995 | $ 2,800 | $ 1,450
2/6/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 4 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

TABULATION SHEET BY DATE OF TRIP

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

DATE OF gﬁ e Ao GROUE City Tours | Clark Travel | “92rBUS | werrville | ok Tours | (Re9EMt | piyercity
San Antonie, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX |
2/6/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | & 1,250
2/6/16 2 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
_2/13/16 | 1 | San Marcos, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1800 $  2265|$ 2500 $ 2,800 | § 1,450
2/20/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | §$ 1,250
2/20/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
2/20/16 2 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
3/5/16 2 New Braunfels, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,250 | ¢ 2,556 | $ 1,400
3/5/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | § 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
3/21/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | § 2,100 | $ 2369 | § 1,250
03/25-26/16 | 1 Kingsville, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 2,500 NoBid | $ 1,700 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,995 | $ 2,900 | $ 2,200
3/26/16 1 New Braunfels, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,450 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,556 | $ 1,400
3/28/16 1 Houston, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,800 No Bid | $ 2,600 | $ 3,340 | $ 3,600 | $ 4,000 | $ 2,475
04/08-09/16 | 1 Austin, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 2,800 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 3,680 | $ 3,800 | $ 2,930 | $ 2,160
04/08-09/16 | 1 San Diego, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 3,000 No Bid | § 1,600 | $ 3,680 | $ 4,200 | $ 2,556 | § 2,280
4/11/16 5 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
4/12/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,900 | $ 1,550
4/13/16 4 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
4/14/16 2 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
04/22-23/16 | 1 San Marcos, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 2,800 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,995 | $ 2,800 | $ 2,280
4/23/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,900 | $ 1,550
4/23/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
5/6/16 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 ‘NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
5/7/16 1 Laredo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
6/19/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 1925 | $ 2,900 | $ 1,675
6/24/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 1925 | $ 2,900 | $ 1,675
Proposal Notes:
1. Prices are per bus
2. Dates and quantity of buses needed are subject to change .
3. Prices are limited to dates outlined in this proposal. Additional trips will need to be quoted once dates become available.
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 5 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

Cougar Bus Regent = =
D":':EI ':JF :!.:3 DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel Lines Kerrville OK Tours CoachiiTae RiverCity
San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonio, TX
9/5/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | § 1,595 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/7/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,350 | ¢ 1,950 | § 1,595 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/14/15 1 Laredo, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | ¢ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
9/17/15 1 Del Rio, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| § 1,250 No Bid | { 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
10/14/15 1 Laredo, TX 7TH & 8TH Grade Volleyball - E. P. J. H.| $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | % 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ 5,950.00
Average per trip: $ 1,190.00
9/3/15 1 Del Rio, TX 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. J. H $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
9/5/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball -M.J. H. | $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | % 1,595 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/14/15 1 Uvalde, TX 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. J. H. | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,550 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/19/15 1 Del Rio, TX | 7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. J. H $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
10/8/15 1 Laredo, TX __7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M.J.H. | § 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/15/15 1 Comstock, TX  7th & 8th Grade Volleyball - M. J. H. | % 1,250 NoBid | $ 1490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,777 | $ 1,250
Recommended Expense: 3 7,100.00
Average per trip: 8 1,183.33
|
9/17/15 2 Del Rio, TX i 8th Grade Football - E. P. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | § 1,150
10/8/15 2 Del Rio, TX 7th Grade Football - E. P. J. H. $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | § 1,150
10/27/15 2 Somerset, TX 7th Grade Football - E. P. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | 4 1,895 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
Recommended Expense: | $ 7,100.00
Average per trip: $ 2,366.67
9/17/15 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX 7th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,350 | § 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,496 | § 1,080
9/17/15 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX 8th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | 4 1,49 | $ 1,080
9/22/15 2 Del Rio, TX 7th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | § 1,496 | $ 1,150
~10/6/15 | 2 Uvalde, TX | 7th Grade Football - M.J.H. | $ 1,250 NoBid[$  1350|$  1950($ 1400 $ 1590 [$ 1,150
10/13/15 2 Del Rio, TX 8th Grade Football - M. J. H. $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1950 | $ 1,400 | $ 149 | $ 1,150
Recommended Expense: | § 11,220.00
Average per trip: $ 2,244.00

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 6 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

Cougar Bus Regent =

D'Ar;EI I:JF ;23 DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel Tines Kerrville OK Tours Corchiling RiverCity

San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX
9/19/15 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/25/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | & 1,925 | 4 2,369 No Bid
10/3/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | % 2,100 | ¢ 2,369 No Bid
10/9/15 5 Uvalde, TX Band - C.C. Winn High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 No Bid
10/10/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | % 2,100 | % 2,369 No Bid
10/17/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | ¢ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/22/15 5 Laredo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | 4 1,490 | § 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/24/15 5 Corpus Christi, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | % 2,100 | $ 3,000 No Bid
10/30/15 5 Laredo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
11/3/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
11/13/15 5 San Antonio, TX | Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
11/20/15 5 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | ¢ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
01/22-23/16 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 2,160
12/12/15 3 Castroville, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 1,964 | § 1,250
1/30/16 1 Cibolo, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1,600 | $ 2,200 | $ 2,250 | % 2,463 | $ 1,350
02/05-06/16 | 1 San Marcos, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,995 | § 2,800 | 4 1,450
2/6/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 2,100 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
2/20/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | % 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
3/5/16 1 San Antonio, TX | Band - C.C. Winn High 4 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | % 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
03/25-26/16 1 Kingsville, TX ' Band - C.C. Winn High 9 2,500 NoBid | $ 1,700 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,995 | $ 2,900 | % 2,200
3/26/16 1 New Braunfels, TX Band - C.C. Winn High : 1,450 No Bid | 4 1,700 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,556 | $ 1,400
04/08-09/16 | 1 Austin, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 2,800 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 3,680 | $ 3,800 | 4 2,930 | $ 2,160
04/08-09/16 | 1 San Diego, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 3,000 NoBid | $ 1,600 | $ 3,680 | $ 4,200 | ¢ 2,556 | $ 2,280
4/13/16 4 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | 4 2,369 | $ 1,250
4/14/16 2 San Antonio, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1,525 | 4 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
04/22-23/16 | 1 San Marcos, TX Band - C.C. Winn High $ 2,800 NoBid | $ 1,800 | 4 3,680 | $ 2,995 | $ 2,800 | $ 2,280
5/7/16 1 Laredo, TX | Band - C.C. Winn High 1 $ 1,600 NoBid | $§ 1490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 [ § 1,250

Recommended Expense: $ 108,125.00
Average per trip: $ 4,004.63
|
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 7 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

s Cougar Bus Regent 3 2
D?.';EI ;)F :ﬁ DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel iaes Kerrville OK Tours mﬁ ihe RiverCity
San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX
8/29/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,350 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 No Bid
9/25/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | § 1,925 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/3/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/8/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/10/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | § 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/15/15 6 Laredo, TX [ Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | 4 1,490 | $ 1,950 | § 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/17/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 NoBid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
10/29/15 6 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
10/31/15 6 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,525 | 4 1,950 | ¢ 2,100 | $ 2,369 No Bid
11/12-14/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX | Band - Eagle Pass High $ 3,000 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 5,020 | $ 3,600 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
11/13/15 6 Laredo, TX | Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
11/20/15 6 Laredo, TX | Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 No Bid
12/04-05/15 | 2 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 2,250 NoBid | 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 2,160
12/11-12/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 4,000 NoBid | § 1,525 | $ 7,690 | $ 2,695 | $ 2,369 | $ 2,160
12/19/15 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
01/21-22/16 | 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 2,160
1/30/16 2 Laredo, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
2/6/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High 3 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
2/6/16 2 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
2/13/16 1 San Marcos, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,300 No Bid | { 1,800 | % 2,265 | $ 2,500 | $ 2,800 | 4 1,450
2/20/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | 4 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
2/20/16 2 San Antonio, TX | Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
3/5/16 2 New Braunfels, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,300 No Bid | % 1,700 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,250 | $ 2,556 | 4 1,400
3/21/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | { 2,369 | § 1,250
3/28/16 1 Houston, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,800 No Bid | $ 2,600 | $ 3,340 | $ 3,600 | ¢ 4,000 | 4 2,475
4/11/16 5 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,525 | 4 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
4/12/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 ~ NoBid|$ 1,700 | % 2,350 | % 1925 | § 2,900 | $ 1,550
4/23/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,900 | 4 1,550
4/23/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
5/6/16 1 San Antonio, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
6/19/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,900 | $ 1,675
6/24/16 1 Kingsville, TX Band - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,700 | $ 2,350 | $ 1,925 | § 2,900 | $ 1,675
Recommended Expense: $ 133,375.00
Average per trip: $ 4,167.97
|
9/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX | Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
~10/9/15 1 Uvalde, TX 1 Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn $ 1,500 | NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/22/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/30/15 1 Laredo, TX Cheerleaders - C.C. Winn $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | % 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ 4,900.00
Average per trip: | $ 1,225.00
8/29/15 1 San Antonio, TX | Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250 |
9/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX | Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
10/8/15 1 Laredo, TX [ Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/15/15 1 Laredo, TX ‘ Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/29/15 1 Laredo, TX | Cheerleaders - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | § 1,925 2,182 | $ 1,250
|Recommended Expense: | $ - 6,250.00 o I
Average per trip: $ 1,250.00
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 8 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

Cougar Bus Regent
DQ_"I;EI :F :'ll"g DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel iles Kerrville OK Tours Coathilne RiverCity
San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
8/22/15 1 | Carrizo Springs, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,195 | § 1,933 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,496 | § 1,080
8/22/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX | Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,195 | $ 1,933 | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,200 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
8/29/15 1 Uvalde, TX | Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1525 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
9/5/15 1 Crystal City, TX | Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
9/19/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
9/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High No Bid NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
10/3/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX | Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
11/7/15 1 Round Rock, TX Cross Country - C.C. Winn High $ 1,650 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,725 | $ 2,350 | $ 3,100 | $ 1,700
Recommended Expense: | $ 11,505.00
Average per trip: | $ 1,278.33
8/14/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 | $ 2,951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
8/22/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,195 | $ 3,666 | $ 1,800 | % 2,200 | $ 1,925 | § 3,000 | $ 1,700
8/29/15 1 Mission, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,850 | $ 3,100 | $ 3,300 | $ 3,600 | $ 1,910
8/29/15 1 Uvalde, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,525 | § 1,590 | § 1,150
9/5/15 1 Crystal City, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,350 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,496 | § 1,080
9/19/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | 4 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
9/24/15 1 Laredo, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | § 1,490 | % 1,950 | $ 1925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 3,000 | $ 1,700
10/3/15 1 Round Rock, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,725 | $ 2,300 | $ 3,100 | $ 1,700
10/3/15 i Uvalde, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,600 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | § 1,590 | 1,150
10/17/15 1 Laredo, TX ‘ Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | ¢ 2,182 | & 1,250
10/26/15 1 Corpus Christi, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | § 3,000 | $ 1,700
11/7/15 1 Round Rack, TX Cross Country - Eagle Pass High $ 1,650 No Bid | $ 1,800 | $ 2,725 [ § 2,350 | $ 3,100 | $ 1,700
Recommended Expense: $ 17,025.00
Average per trip: $ . 1,309.62 o
8/14/15 2 Pearsall, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,500 | $ 2317 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,850 | $ 1,870 | § 1,150
8/21/15 2 Del Rio, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 | $ 2,595 | ¢ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
8/27/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
9/3/15 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
9/24/15 2 San Antonio, TX | Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | % 2,369 | § 1,250
10/8/15 2 Uvalde, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
10/21/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/29/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - C.C. Winn High | $ 1,500 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ - 19,060.00 ) |
Average per trip: $ 2,382.50
8/14/15 2 Laredo, TX . Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,400 | $ 2,951 | $ 1,490 | 4 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/2/15 2 Laredo, TX Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | 4 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/17/15 2 San Antonio, TX | Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
10/22/15 2 Laredo, TX | Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | ¢ 2,182 | $ 1,250
11/5/15 2 Del Rio, TX | Freshmen Football - Eagle Pass High | $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | ¢ 149 | $ 1,150
Recommended Expense: [ $ 12,300.00
Average per trip: | $ 2,460.00

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 9 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP
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Cougar Bus 2 Regent
DgEI I?F gﬁ DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel i Kerrville OK Tours Coach Line RiverCity
San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX
8/14/15 2 Pearsall, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 | $ 2317 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,850 | $ 1,870 | $ 1,150
8/21/15 2 Del Rio, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 | $ 2,595 | § 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,496 | $ 1,150
8/27/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/3/15 2 | Carrizo Springs, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | ¢ 1,200 | 4 1,496 | § 1,080
10/1/15 2 San Antonio, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
10/15/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1490 | $ 1950 | $ 1,925 | 4 2,182 | $ 1,250
11/4/15 2 Somerset, TX J. V. Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,895 | 4§ 2,182 | $ 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ 16,760.00
Average per trip: $ 2,394.29
8/14/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 | $ 2951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
8/28/15 2 San Antonio, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/2/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/17/15 2 San Antonio, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | { 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,369 | $ 1,250
10/22/15 2 Laredo, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,300 No Bid | $ 1,490 | § 1,950 | § 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
11/5/15 2 Del Rio, TX J. V. Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
Recommended Expense: | $ 14,700.00
Average per trip: $ 2,450.00
8/6/15 1 Del Rio, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | $ 2416 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,395 | § 1,496 | § 1,150
8/12/15 1 Uvalde, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,100 | $ 2,458 | § 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,595 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
8/18/15 1 Schertz, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | % 3,267 | $ 1,550 | $ 2,200 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,463 | { 1,300
8/25/15 1 Uvalde, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,525 | § 1,590 | § 1,150
9/15/15 1 Laredo, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
9/22/15 1 Del Rio, TX | Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,150
10/6/15 1 Laredo, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | { 1925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/16-17/15 | 1 Laredo, TX | Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 2,200 No Bid | § 1,490 | $ 3,700 | { 2,695 | $ 2,182 | { 2,400
10/22-24/15 | 1 Laredo, TX \ Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 3,500 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 5,020 | 1 3695 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/30-31/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Tennis - Eagle Pass High $ 2,500 No Bid | $ 1,525 | $ 3,680 | $ 2,695 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ 12,240.00
Average per trip: $ 1,224.00
8/14/15 2 Pearsall, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 | ¢ 2317 | $ 1,450 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,850 | $ 1,870 | § 1,150
8/21/15 2 Del Rio, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 | § 2,595 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,350 | $ 1,496 | § 1,150 |
9/25/15 2 San Antonio, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High No Bid NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | 4§ 2,369 | § 1,250
10/9/15 2 Uvalde, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,500 NoBid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,400 | ¢ 1,590 | § 1,150
10/22/15 2 Laredo, TX |  Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,300 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | § 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/30/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - C.C. Winn High $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ 14,400.00
Average per trip: $ 2,400.00
8/14/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 | $ 2,951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 1,250
8/29/15 2 San Antonio, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,400 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,895 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
9/25/15 2 San Antonio, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High No Bid NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | § 1,250
10/8/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/15/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,25_9_
10/29/15 2 Laredo, TX Varsity Football - Eagle Pass High $ 1,500 NoBid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
Recommended Expense: 1% R 15,000.00 o - _
Average per trip: $ 2,500.00

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 10 of 11
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 162207 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET BY GROUP

: Cougar Bus I Regent 3 .
Dﬁ;!i :F (B;s DESTINATION GROUP City Tours | Clark Travel tinas Kerrville OK Tours Coach Line RiverCity
San Antonio, TX Taylor, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX
08/13-15/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 2,250 | 4 5350 | $ 1,525 | $ 5020 | $ 3,035 | $ 3,771 | § 2,400
08/20-22/15 | 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 2,250 | 4 5350 [ $ 1,525 | $ 5020 | $ 3,305 $ 3,771 | § 2,400
8/22/15 1 Uvalde, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,350 | 4 1,950 | $ 1,525 | $ 1,590 | § 1,150
08/27-29/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 2,600 No Bid | $ 1,490 | ¢ 5020 | $ 3305 % 4,021 | § 1,250
9/11/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | ¢ 1,925 | § 2,182 | § 1,250
9/22/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,490 | % 1,950 | § 1925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
9/25/15 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High No Bid NoBid | $ 1,525 | § 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
10/9/15 1 Uvalde, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,400 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1950 | $ 1,400 | $ 1,590 | § 1,150
10/13/15 1 Somerset, TX Valleyball - C.C. Winn High 4 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | § 1,895 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/23/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - C.C. Winn High $ 1,700 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
10/27/15 1 Castroville, TX | Volleyball - C.C. Winn High E 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,500 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 1,964 | § 1,250
Recommended Expense: $ 14,825.00
Average per trip: $ 1,347.73
8/7/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,100 | $ 2,951 | $ 1,490 | % 1,950 | $ 1,925 | $ 2,182 | $ 1,250
8/11/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | $ 2951 | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | $ 1,925 | § 2,182 | 4 1,250
08/13-15/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2,400 5350 | $ 1,490 | $ 5020 | $ 3,035 | § 4,021 | % 2,400
08/13-15/15 1 San Antonio, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2,250 | § 5350 | $ 1,525 | 4 5020 | $ 3,035 | { 3,771 | § 2,400
8/18/15 1 Carrizo Springs, TX | Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 | § 2,335 | 4 1,350 | $ 1950 | $ 1,200 | & 1496 | $ 1,080
08/20-22/15 | 1 Floresville, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2400 | $ 5350 | $ 1,550 | $ 5,020 | $ 3,305 | ¢ 2463 | § 1,300
8/22/15 1 Knippa, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High g 1,250 | § 2,535 | % 1,400 | $ 2,200 | $ 3,300 | $ 1,590 | $ 1,150
8/25/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1950 | $ 1925 | § 2,182 | $ 1,250
08/27-29/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 2,600 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 5020 | $ 3,305 | $ 4,021 | $ 1,250
9/1/15 1 Crystal City, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | § 1,950 | $ 1,250 | $ 1,49 | $ 1,080
9/8/15 1 Poteet, TX ' Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,200 No Bid | $ 1,550 | $ 2,350 | $ 2,100 | $ 2,369 | $ 1,250
9/22/15 1 Jourdanton, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,350 No Bid | $ 1,550 | § 1,950 | $ 1,400 | $ 2,151 | § 1,250
9/26/15 | 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High No Bid No Bid | § 1,490 [ $ 1,950 | § 1,925 | % 2,182 | 4 1,250
9/29/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | § 1,950 | ¢ 1,925 | § 2,182 | 8 1,250
10/6/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 NoBid | $ 1,525 | $ 1,950 | § 1,925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/20/15 1 Laredo, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,490 | $ 1,950 | § 1925 | $ 2,182 | § 1,250
10/27/15 1 Del Rig, TX Volleyball - Eagle Pass High $ 1,250 No Bid | $ 1,350 | $ 1,950 | % 1,400 | § 1,49 | § 1,150
Recommended Expense: $ 20,975.00
Average per trip: $ 1,233.82
|
|
Total Recommended expense in this proposal: $ 452,810.00
Total number of trips in this proposal: 185
Average per trip: $ 2,447.62
Proposal Notes: ‘
1. Prices are per bus \ o o 5ol
2. Dates and quantity of buses needed are subject to change
3. Prices are Iin‘luited to dates outlined in this‘proposal. Additional trips will need to be quoted once dates become available.
|

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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