Bid Request Number Bid 09-50

Title Plumbing Repair Parts
Description

Bid Type BID

Open Date 7/21/2009 8:00:00 AM Central
Close Date 8/4/2009 3:00:00 PM Central

Need by Date

[Responding  Suppliers

Name Note to Buyer
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS
QUATRO PRODUCTS CORPORATION

[Line 1 Regal Flushometer W/C #110
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 11 EA 62 682
QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 11 EA No Bid

[Line 2 Regal Flushometer Urinal #186
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 11 EA 62 682
[Line 3 Guide Assembly #A-163-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 336 EA 0.65 218.4
QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 336 EA No Bid
[Line 4 Handle Complete #B-32-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA 4.95 178.2
QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 36 EA No Bid
[Line 5 Handle Coupling Nut #A-6
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 60 EA 2.74 164.4



QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 60 EA No Bid

[Line 6 Relief Valve W/C #A-19-AC
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 288 EA 1.64 472.32

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 288 EA No Bid

[Line 7 Relief Valve Urinal #A-19-AU
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 144 EA 1.64 236.16

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 144 EA No Bid

[Line 8 Vacuum Breaker #V-551-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 132 EA 1.09 143.88

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 132 EA No Bid

[Line 9 Handle Repair Kit #8-50-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 300 EA 1.14 342

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 300 EA No Bid

[Line 10 Flushvalve Inside Cover #A-71
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 11 EA 1.13 12.43

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 11 EA No Bid

[Line 11 Flushvalve Outside Cover  Chrome #A-72
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 11 EA 10.7 1177

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 11 EA No Bid

[Line 12 Slip Joint Stop Nipple 2 1/16 #H-551-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 22 EA 6.85 150.7

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 22 EA No Bid



[Line 13

Slip Joint Stop Nipple

3 1/16 #H-551-A

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 22 EA 5.75 126.5

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP¢( 22 EA No Bid

{Line 14 Slip Joint Stop Nipple 4 1/16 #H-551-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 22 EA 4.43 97.46

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 22 EA No Bid

[Line 15 Coupling Nut for Stop Nipple _ #H-550-CP
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA 1.15 414

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP¢( 36 EA No Bid

[Line 16 Slip Joint Stop Angle ?  #H-600-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA 2.49 59.76

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 24 EA No Bid

[Line 17 Slip Joint Stop Angle 1 #H-600-A
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA 25 60

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORPt 24 EA No Bid

{Line 18 Stop Repair ? #3308856

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA 2.53 91.08

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 36 EA No Bid

|Line 19 Stop Repair 1 #3308853

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA 253 91.08

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 36 EA No Bid
{Line 20 Stop Cap ? #H-582

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification




MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA 1.99 71.64

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 36 EA No Bid

[Line 21 Stop Cap1 #H-573

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA 1.99 71.64

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 36 EA No Bid

[Line 22 Snap Ring  #H-552

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 72 EA 0.29 20.88

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 72 EA No Bid

[Line 23 #42 O-Ring #H-553

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 6 EA 0.04 0.24

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 6 EA No Bid

[Line 24 Old Style Stop Kit ? #3308853
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 28 EA 2.53 70.84

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 28 EA No Bid

[Line 25 Old Style Stop Kit 1 #3308856
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 28 EA 2.53 70.84

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 28 EA No Bid

[Line 26 Old Style Stop Kit 1 #3308856
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 28 EA 1.83 51.24

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 28 EA No Bid

[Line 27 Diaphram Kit #A-156-AA
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 492 EA 317 1559.64

QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 492 EA No Bid



{Line 28 Handicap Handle #B-73-A

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 22 EA 8.15 179.3
QUATRO PRODUCTS CORP( 22 EA No Bid

Successful Bidder



