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TERMS AND CONDITIONS FOR ACCEPTANCE OF MONIES FROM 

BUILDING RENEWAL GRANT FUND 

School District: Amphitheater Unified District 

School: L M Prince School 

BRG Project Number: BRG-003948 

Project Title: 

1. PURPOSE OF TERMS AND CONDITIONS

These Terms and Conditions apply to the distribution of monies by the School Facilities Division 
(SFD, or "Division") from the Building Renewal Grant Fund ("Fund") pursuant to Arizona Revised 
Statutes, ("A.R.S.") §41-5732, §41-5701, and §41-5702. 

These monies are being awarded to the District for the purpose of maintaining the adequacy of 
existing school facilities owned by school districts that are required to meet the minimum 
adequacy standards for student capacity and that fall below the minimum school facility guidelines 
found in A.AC. Title 7, sections R7-6-101 through R7-6-276. Districts are prohibited from using 
monies from the Fund awarded pursuant to these Terms and Conditions on any project that is in 
a building, or part of a building, that is being leased to another entity. All monies used must be in 
compliance with the statutory requirements found in A.R.S. §41-5732, 
A.AC. Title 7 section R7-1-101, and the Building Renewal Grant Policy adopted on October 2,
2008 and as subsequently amended, as well as any applicable session law.

2. TERM OF TERMS AND CONDITIONS

The term of these Terms and Conditions shall begin on the initial date of the performance period 
and shall continue until the project is closed, pursuant to Paragraph 4.2. A project shall be 
complete within 12 months per A.R.S. §41-5732. 

2.1 ABANDONMENT OF THE PROJECT 

A Project or phase grant may be considered to be abandoned if the acceptance process, 
including, the submittal of the purchase order(s) has not been completed by the District within 
four months of award of funding or the project has had no activity in over a 6 month period. In 
such an instance, the project or phase grant may be subject to administrative closeout and any 
monies awarded may be de-obligated from the project or phase grant and returned to the fund. 
Abandonment of a project does not relieve a District of its obligation to correct the deficiency and 
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tier to the extent necessary to ensure compliance with the requirements. 

The District shall comply with all laws, statutes, ordinances, rules, codes, and regulations 
applicable to any school district. 

23. CERTIFICATION/ AUTHORIZATION

These Terms and Conditions must be signed by the President of the Governing Board, 
Superintendent andthe CFO/Business Manager of the District and certifies that he or she has 
read these Terms and Conditions and represents and warrants that he or she is duly authorized 
to agree and accept and therefore sign these Terms and Conditions on behalf of the District. 

BRG Project Number: BRG-003948 

Governing Board President (signature) 

Deanna M. Day 

Name (printed/typed) 

Superintendent (signature) 

Todd A. Jaeger, J. D.

Name (printed/typed) 

CFO/Business Manager (signature) 

Scott Little
Name (printed/typed) 

Date 

Amphitheater Unified District 

School District 

Date 

Date 
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